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Prologue

Nations, it has recently become commonplace to observe, are in part
imagined c\Ömmunities, depending for their credibility and identity
both or.r_the legitimacy of government and the appararus of the state;
and on invented traditions, manufactured myths, and shared percep-
tions of the social order that are never more than crude categories and
oversimplified stereotypes.l If this has been rrue (as indeed it has) of a
relatively compact and contained cäuntry like Britain, then how much
more true must this have been of the empire that the British conquered
and peopled, administered and ruled? At its territorial zenith, shortly
after the end of the First World 'Ųfar, it consisted of naval stations and
military bases extending from Gibraltar to Hong Kong, the four great
dominions of settļement, the Indian Empire that occupied an entire
subcontinent, the crown colonies in Asia, Africa and the Caribbean,
and the League of Nations Mandates, especially in the Middļe East.z
But, as with all such transoceanic realms, the British Empire was
not only a geop6litical entiry: it was also a culturally created and
imaginatively constructed artifact. How, then, in the heyday of its
existence, did Britons imagine and envisage their unprecedentedly vast
and varied imperium, not so much geographically as sociologically?
How did they try to otganize and to arĪange their heterogeneous
irnperial society, as they settled and conquered, governed and ruled it,
and what did they think the resulting sociaļ order looked like?3

To the extent that they tried to conceive ofthese diverse colonies and
varied populations beyond the seas as 'an entire interactive system,
one vast interconnected world', most Britons followed the standard
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pattern of human behaviour when contemplating and comprehending

the unfamįliar. Their 'inner predisposition' was to begin with what
they knew - or what they thought they knew - namely, the social
structure of their own home country.a.But what sort of a starting point
was this, and what were the implications and consequences of British

Perceptioįls of their domestic social order for British perceptions of
their imperial social order? From Hegel to Marx, and from Engels to

Said, it has been commonplace to suggest that Britons saw their own

society (and, by extension, that of what became their settler dominions)

as dynamic, individualistic, egalitarian, modernizing I and thus superidrl

By comparison with such a positive and progressive metropolitan

perception, this argument continues, Britons saw society in their 'tropi-
cal' aird'oriental'colonies as enervated, hierarchical, corpoĪatist, back-

ward - and thus inferior.s But among its many flaws, this appealingly

simplistic (and highly influential) contrast is based on a mistaken

premise, in that it fundamentally misunderstands most Britons'percep-

tions of their domestic social worļd when their nation was at its zenith

as an imperial power.

Far from seeing themselves as atomized individuals with no rooted

sense of identity, or as collective classes coming into being and strug-

gling with each other, or as equal citizens whose modernity engendered

an unrivalled sense of progressive superiority, Britons generally con-

ceived of themselves as belonging to aĪr unequal society characterized

by a seamless web of layered gradations, which were hallowed by time

and precedĖnq which were sanctioned by tradition and religion, and

which extended in a great chain of being from the monarch at the

top to the humblest subiect at the bottom.6 That was how they saw

themselves, and it was from that starting point that they contemplated

and tried to comprehend the distant realms and dįverse society of their

empire. This in tĮļrn meānt that for the British, their overseas realms

were at least as much about sameness as they were about difference.

For insofar as they regarded their empire as 'one vast interconnected

world', they did not necessarily do so in disadvantaged or critical

contrast to the way they perceived their own metropolitan society.

Rather, they were at least as likely to envisage the social structure of

their empire - as their predecessors had done before them - by analogy
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to what they knew of 'home', or in replication of it, or in parallel to it,
or in extension of it, or (sometimes) in idealization of it, or (even, and
increasingly) in nostalgia for it.7

This means that we need to be much more attenrive to the varied -
sometimes, even, contradictory - ways in which the British understood,
visualized and imagined their empire hierarchically. To be sure, oze of
the ways in which they did so was in racial terms of superiority and
inferiority. Like all post-Enlightenment imperial powers, onJy more so,
Britons saw themselves as the lords of all the worĮd and thus of
humankind. They placed themselves at the top of the scale of civiļiz-
ation and achievemenr, they ranked all other races in descending order
beneath thern, according to their relativ_e merits (and de-merits), and
during the period r78o to r 83o they increasingly embodied these views
in imperial institutions and codes.8 And when it came to the sysremaric
settlement of Canada, Australia, New Zealand and South Africa, they
did not hesitate to banish the indigenous peoples to the margins of the

new, imperial society. By the enģ of the nineteenth century these

notions of racial hierarchy, supremacy and stereotyping had become
more fully developed, and stridently hardened, as exemplified iĪļ Cecil
Rhodes's remark that 'the British are the finest race in the world, and
the more of the world they inhabit, the better ir will be for mankind',
or in Lord Cromer's belief that the world was divided berween those
who were British and those who were merely'subiect races'.e

ln short, and as Peter Marshall has observed, 'Empire reinforced a

hierarchical view of the world, in which the British occupied a pre-
eminent place among the colonial powers, while those subjected to
colonial rule were raiged below them, in varying degrees of supposed
inferiority.'lo These facts are familiar and incontrovenible. But this
mode of imperial ranking and imaging was not just based on the
Enlightenment view of the intrinsic inferiority of dark-skinned peoples:
it was alŠo based Ön notions of metropolitan-peripheral analogy and
sameness. For as the British contemplated the unprecedented numbers
massed together in their new industrial cities, they tended to compare
these great towns at home with the 'dark continents' overseas, and
thus equate the workers in factories with coloured peoples abroad.
The 'shock cities' of the r83os and r84os were seen as resembling
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BEGINNINGS

'darkest Africa'in their distant, unknown and unfathomable menaces;

and during the third quarter of the nineteenth century London's newĮy

discovered 'residuum' and 'dangerous classes' were likened - in their
character and their conduct - to the 'negroes' of empire. And these

domestic-imperial analogies were worked and extended in the oppo-
site dirėction as well: one additional reason why'natives'in the empire

were regarded as collectively inferior was that they were seen as the

overseas equivalent of the'undeserving poor'in Britain.ll .

To some.degree, then, these analogies and comparisons that Britons

drew and made between domestic and overseaš societies, from the

eighteenth to the twentieth centuries, served to reinforce the prevailing

Enlightenment notions of racial superiority and inferiority. And it įs
from this premise that the British Empire has been viewed by contem-

poraries and by historians as an eįteĪprise that was built and main-

tained on the basis of the collective, institutionalized and politicized

ranking of races. But, as these analogies and comparisons also s Īggest,

this was not the only way in which Britons envisioned their empire, arid

its imperial society, as an essentially hierarchical organism. For there

was another vantage-point from which they regarded the inhabitants of.

their far-flung realms, which was also built around notions of superi-

ority and inferiority, but which frequently cut across, and sometimes

overturned and undermined, the notion that the British Empire was

based solely and completely on a hierarchy of race. This alternative

approach was, indeed, the conventional way in which the English (and

latterly the British) had regarded the inhabitants of other, alien worlds,

for it was a perspective that long antedated the Enlightenment.

It has certainly been traced back to the sixteenth and seventeenth

centuries, for when the English first ėncountered the native peoples of

North America, they did not see them collectively as a race of inferior

savages; on the contrary, they viewed them individuaĮly as felĮow

human beings. It was from this pre-Enlightenment Perspective that the

English concluded that North American sociery closely resembled their

own: a carefully graded hierarchy of status, extending in a seamless

web from chiefs and princes at the top to less wortĻ figures at the

bottom. Moreover, these two essentially hierarchical societies were
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BEGĪNNINGs

seen as coexisting, not iį a relationship of (English) superiority and
(North American) inferiority, but in a relationship of equivalence and
similaricy: princes in one society were the analogues to princes in
another, and so on and so on, all the way down these two parallel
sociaļ ladders. In short, when the English initially contemplated native
Americans, they saw them as social equals rather than as social
inferiors, and when they came to apply theii conventionalry hierarchi-
cal tools of observation, tĮeir prime grid of analysis was individual
status ratļrer than collective race.72

It is the argument of this book that these attitudes, whereby social
ranking was as important as (perhaps more important than?) colour
of skin in contemplating the extra-metroPolįtan world, remained
irnportant for the English and, latterly, for the British long after it
has been generally supposed they ceased to matteĪ. To be sure, the
Enlightenment brought abour a new, collective way of looking at
peoples, raceŠ and colours, based on distarrce and separation and
otherness. But it did not subveft the earlier, individualistic, analogical
way of thinking, based on the observation of sratus similarities and the
cuļtivation of affinides, that projected domestically oģinated Percep-
tions of the social order overseas.l3 On the contrary, this essentially
pre-racial way of seeing t'hings lasted for as long as the British Empire
lasted. Here is one example. In the srļmmer of r88r King Kalakaua of
Hawaii was visiting England and, in the course of an extensive round
of sociaļ engagements, he found himseļf the guest at a Party given by
Lady Spencer. Aļso attending were the prince of Wales, who would
eventually become King Edward VII, and the German crown prince,
who was his brother-in-law and the future kaiser. The prince of Wales
insisted that the king should take precedence'over the crown prince,
and when his brother_in-law objecteģ he offered the following iithy
and trenchant justification: 'Either the brute is a king, or he,s a common
or garden nigger; and if the latter, whar's he doing here?,la

Read one way, this is, to our modern sensibilities, a deeply insensitive
and offensively racist observation; read from another viewpoint, this
was, by the convėntions of its. own time, a Yery unracist remark.
The traditionaĮ, pre-Enlightenment freemasonry based on the shared
recognition of high social ranļ< _ a freemasonry to which Martin Malia
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has suggestively given the name 'aristocratic internationalism, - both
trumped and trānscended the alternative and more recent freemasonry

based on the unifying characteristic of shared skin colour. From this
perspective, the hierarchical principle that underlay Britons' percep-
tions of their empire was not exclusively based on the collective,
colour-coded ranking of social groups, but depended as much on the

more venerable colour-blind ranking of individual social prestige.ls
This means there were at least two visions of empire that were essen-

tially (and elaborateiy) hierarchical: one cenrred on colour, the other
on class. So, in the Raj Quartet,Major Ronald Merrick, whose social
background \Mas; rgĮatiyęļy lowly, believed that 'the English were
superior to all irther races, esįecially blacĘ. But the Cambridģe-
educated Ggy Perron feels a greater affinity with the Indian Hari
Kumar, who went to the same public school as he did, than he does
with Merrick, who is very much his social inferior.l6

The British Empire has been extensively studied as a'comp\ex raciaĮ
hierarchy (and also as a less complex gender hierarchy); but it has
received far less attentiorį as an equally complex sociaĮ hierarchy or,
indeed, as a social organism, or.construct, of any kind. This constant
(and largely unquestioned) privileging of colour over class, of race over
rank, of collectivities over individualities, in the scholarly literature
has opened up many important new li es of inquiry. But it has also
meant that scarcely any attention has been paid to empire as a f nc-
tioning social structure and as an imagined social entiry, in which, as
Karen Ordahļ Kupperman puts it, 'status is fundamentaļ to aļl other
categories'.l7 Yer throughout its history, the views expressed by the
prince of 'Wales reflected generally held opinions about the sociaļ
arrangements existing in ihe empire. These attitudes and perceptions
were certainly still in existence in the late eighteenth and early nine-
teenth centuries.l8 But they were no ļess important between the 185os
and the Ī95os, when the ideal of social hierarchy was seen as the
model towards which the great dominions shouļd approimate, when
it formed the basis of the fully elaborated Raj in India, when it provided
the key to the doctrine of 'indirect rule' in Africa, when įt formed the
template for the new nations created in the British Middle Easr, when
it was codified and rationalized by the irriperial honours sysrem, and

9



BĒGINNINGs

when ir was legitimated and unified by the imperial monarchy. In all
these ways, rhe theory and the practice of social hierarchy served to
eradicate the differences, and to homogenize the heterogeneities, of
empire.

of course, even in the heyday of empire these hierarchicar structures
and constructs, impulses and images, imaginings and ideologies, based
on status rather than race' \Ā/ere never wholly pervasive or persuasive.
And they were often founded on serious misunderstandings (sometimes
deliberate, sometimes inadvertent) of imperial sociery, whether in the
metropolis or on the periphery.Butthey uere the conyentioaaļ wisdom
of the official mind in the metropolis, and of their collaborators on the
peripheries, and of many people in Britain and the empire who also
envisaged this 'vasr interconnected world, in traditional, Burkeian
terms. The resr of rhis book will sketch out, in a necessarily abridged
and schematic form, an accounr of the British Empire in which the
concept of hierarchy as social prestige is brought more closely to the
centre of things than historians have generally allowed. As such, it
urges the importance of seeing and undersranding the British Empire as
a mechanism for the export, projection and analogization of domestic
sociaļ structures and social perceptions. For most of its history, the
British visualized and understood their empire oz their outnterms,and
we need to know more about what they were, and about how they did
so. We should never forget that the British Empire was first and
foremost a class act, where įndividual social ordering often took pre_

cedence over collective racial othering.
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Precursors

In governing themselves and much of the rest of the world, the English
(and subsequently the British) adhered to a limited number of prin-
ciples, pracģces and perceptions that were long_standing and deeply

rooted. From the time of the Tudors, EngĮish local government was

usually undertaken by those with the highest social prestĻ' This
meant that it was in the hands of traditional authorities, the great

grandees and the lesser gentry, that it wąs relatively inexpensive, and

that it was amateur. lVhen 'IVales, Scotļand and lreland were sub-

sequently brought into a greater.British realm, they too were adminis-

tered through the social leaders of their respective communities, from
whom power and authority descended, and who were in contact and

alliance with Westminster and Whitehall. This was 'indirect rule'
before its imperial time had come: the way the English, and sub-
sequently the British, visualized themselves - and governed tļemselves
on the basis of this visualizaįion. England and Britain were hierarchical
societies, and those at the top of the social hierarchy were also those

who wieĮded power.i And when Britons turned their attention to those

wider worlds that they colonized and conquered, it was with these

views of how socieŲ was, and of how it should be administered,very
firmly embedded in their minds.

The first British Empire consisted primarily of a western Adantic
dominion extending from Canada, via the thirteen American colonies,

to the Caribbģan, and reached its peak in the briefyears between 1763

and ry76.2 Out of its post-Yorktown wreckage was born its successor,

which was a much more far-flung and. varied realm. The Caribbean
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colonies were rerained and augmented, and those of French and English
canada were resrrucrured and reformed by the legisration of x79r.But.
as a consequence of the Revolutionary and Napoleonic .W.ars, 

the
primary drive towards empire was diverted to the east: large tacts of
South Asia were conquered and subdued, and new colonies were
acquired from the Cape of Good Hope to Singapore. The result, it has
often been argued, was an empire that would not only expand still
further in Asia and in Africa during the second harf of the nineteenth
centĮrry, but also an empire with two very different traditions of
politics and government. In what would.become the great dominions
of settlement, there would be a gradual but inexorable move to rep_
resentative and responsible government, to nationhood and dominion
status. But in the colonies of conquest, there would be authoritarian
administrations, which would eventually be abruptly.terminated by
nationalist agitation and independence.3

There is much truth and insight in this picture. Bur, whire the politics,
government and constitutional evolution of these two realms of empire
may have been different, their societies were belįeved to have more
in common than is sometimes supposed. Įn the great dominions of
settlement, there were two alternative models of the social worļd that
the emĻants were creating. one was that, in revolt against the rigid
hierarchies of Britain, and assisted by the seerningry rimitress supplies
of land, the new colcinies would be founded on the basis of freedom,
independence and equality. But the other was that, instead of rejecting
the hierarchies of the imperial metropolis, the chief ambition of many
settlers wās to replicate them and nurture them - an ambition generally
shared by the policy-makers in the metropolis itself.a In India and the
crown colonies of conquest, there were also two discrepant views of
the societies and polities thus acquired. The first was that'the native
regimes and hierarchies were backward, inefficient, despotic and cor-
rupt, and had to be overthrown and reconstructed according to the
more advanced model of western society and politics. The second was
that they were traditional and organic, an authentic world of ordered,
harmonious,'time-hallowed social relations of the kind that the Įndus_
trial Revolution was threatening (or destroying) in Britain, and that,
therefore had to be cherished, preserved and nurtrįred overseas as a

PRECU RS OR S

more wholesome version of sociery than could now be found in the

metropolis.s

In other words, and notwithstanding their many differences of poli-
tics, government. and constitutional evolution, the emigrant societies
established in th'e colonies of settlement, and the indigenous societies
discovered in the colonies ofconquest, were both regarded from per-
spectives that might be anti-hierarchical (reject the British sysrem,
overthrow the native system) or, alternatively, from perspectives that
might be pro-hierarchical (transplant the British sysrem, preserve the
native systgm). In short-term episodes of rejection and reform, when
tifļes were scorned in the colonies, and when native rulers were deposed
in India or Africe, the anti-hierarchical impu_Įses were certainly in
evidence. )Ąnd in the long run they eventually won out, both in the
former dominions of settiement, which came to pride themseļves on
being more egalitarian than the old mother country, and in the colonies
of rule, which with independence became republics and aboļished the
structures and uappings of imperial hierarchy. But in the medium rerm

- a period that encompasses most of its centuries-long existence -
the British Empire, in both its settlement dominions and colonies of
co quest, was generally built around the principles of replicating and
supporting a hierarchįcaį social structure modelled on, of Įikened to,
and tįed in with, that which it was thouģt existed (or had once existed)
in Britain itself. These impulses and perceptiÕnŠ reached their fu.Įlest

and widest extent in the heyday-of empire, frorn the mid nineteenth to
the mid twentieth centuries. But there were ample precedents in the
earlier phases of imperial expansion and settlement, especially during
the era of the Revolutio ary and Napoleonic 'W'ars, and it is worth
glancing briefly at that period ro set the scene for later developments.

In the British colonies on the eastern seaboard of America, these
hierarchical aftitudes and raditional preferences, borh ethnic and
social, were strongly in eviįlence from the beginning. There was the
contemptible dismissal of indigenous non-white races, native peoples
and African Ämericans as inferior beings, classically illustrated by the
opinions of Edmund. Burke. For him, 'negro slaves' were 'fierce and
cruel tribes of savages, in whom the vestiges of human nature are
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nearlyeffaced by ignorance and barbariry'; and the Indians were merely
'several gangs of bandirti', of 'the most cruel and atrocious kind,.6
Now and then, in rhe manner of their Tudor and Stuart predecessors,
the British would recognize native chiefs as superior figures in a sociar
hierarchy that could be compared to their own (as on the occasion of
the visit of four supposed Iroquois kings to London in rTro or six
Cherokee chiefs in t73o), or seek military alļiances with them (as in
the t76os and ry7os). But these were the excePtions thāt proved the
rule.7 It was the same in the'Ųfest Indies, where slavery - and the trade
in human cargo from'West Africa acrosš the Atlantic _ was taken for
granted as part of the immutable order of things. Even its abolition
was intended to reinforce, rather tļr'an overturn, a hįerarchical view of
society, on the presumption that although sļaves should become free,
they would still remain dignified and obediĖnt at the bottom of the
social order: liberry, yes; but subordination also. Thereafter, there was
a general hardening of British anitudes to coloniai indigenes - a view
that would subsequently be replicated by British se lers in nineteenth-
century Canada, Australia, New Zealand and South Africa.s

But on top of these marginalized and exploited native populations,
many British settlers overseas sought to create a full-scale replica of
the elaborateĮy graded social hierarchy they had left behind at home.
From this perspective, empire.was about the replication of rank, not
the rejection of it. Accordingly, in the thirteen American colonies, by
the mid.eighteenth century, the countryside seemed increasingly settled

and ordered on the English pattern, with great estates, elegant man-
sions, resident gentry, and alļ the accoutrements of traditional sociery:

fox hunts, coats of arms, swords and periwigs: Titles such as Esquire,
Gent, Master and Honourable were used to show who,was who;
church pe\Ms were assigned on the basis of social position; and there

were eveĪļ requests to establish a colonial Peeruge.In such aĮayered,
aspiring, established sqciety, it was generally believed rhat everyone
had 'their appointed offices, places and starion'; that 'God hath
ordained different degrees and orders of men'; and that rhere was 'a

beauty of order in society, as when the different meiĪļbers . . . have alĮ
their appointed offices, place and situation'. Thus regarded, colonial
America was indeed a very hierarchical society, a titļe-conscious place,
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with a prestige order that corresponded roughly with economic rank
order. He ce, for those opposed to British government, the need to

abolish titļes in America after the revolution of x776.9

Eventually, in the newly formed United States, rhese anti-hierarchical
impulses woĪt out, and the country was laurrched on a non-British,
non-imperial trajectory of republican constitutionalism and egalitarian
social perceptions. Thereafter, the British vowed that this shouļd never

happen again in their empire, which meant that elsewhere in their
colonies hierarchy was nurtured and supported, and social revolution
thwarted. In the late eighteenth and early nineteenth centuries 'else-

where' meant, essentially, Ireland, Canada and India. The Act of
Union of r8oo br)6ught togetheį Great Britain alrd Įreland in a new.,

imperiaĻcu}n-metropolitan unity. Although it was now, legally,.part
of the imperial metropolis, the regime established in Dublin provided

the proconsuĮar prototype for what would later evolve on the imperial
periphery, in India, in the dominions of sertlemenr, and eventually in
the dependent empire. The monarch was ĖepreŠented by a viceroy, who
resided, in appropriately royal style, in Dublin Castle, and who was

invariably a high-ranking aristocrat. Among the earliest occupants of
the post were the Dukes of Richmond, Bedford and Northumberland,
and the Marquess ! ellesley. The viceroy was the cynosure and apex

of a hierarchical vision of lrish socieŅ, which was regularly proclaimed
by the courtly ceremonial of state entries, audiences, investitures,

levees, parades änd entertainments, by the courtly retinue of chamber-

lains, comptrolĮers, heralds and pursuivants, and by the chapters and
instalļations of the order of St Patrick (of which the viceroy was grand
masteĪ), which had been founded in t783.1o

These developments in lreland, towards proconsular splendour as a

reassertioį of hierarchy, were also being paralleled and replicated in
Canada. As it happened, French society in Quebec was pre-r789 in its
seigneurial structure and veneration for monarcby, and in tĮris regard
it had much in common with the British sociery being established in
neighbouring Ontario, where most of the immigrants were conserva-
tive refugees fl6eing from the thirteen colonies, and eager to proclaim
tļreir continuing loyalty to Britain's throne and rigid sociaļ order.
Moreover, in ry9r the younger Pitt planned to provide an hereditary
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uPPer house in anxious but determined response to the mistaken
egalitarianism of the French (and American) Revolutions. By all these
means, the principal aim was 'to avoid a replica of democratic New
England', and to inculcate'a due deference and homage for superiors'
and a degree of'subordination necessary to civilized society,.rl And
during the late eighteenth and early nineteenrh centuries the full pan-
oply of proconsular aggrandizement and mimetic monarchy was
unfurled, with elaborare pageantry and ceremonial, orchestrated by
such parrician governors as Lord Dorchester in euebec, Lord Dal-
housie in canada and John lfenrworth in Nova scotia (and also, half
a world away, by Lord Charles Somerset at the recently acquired Cape
of Good Hope).l2 Here were precedents aplenty for later imperial
developments in Australia, New Zealand arrd South Africa.

It was not the same - and yet in other ways, it was very much
the same - in South Asia, where the late-eighteenrh-century British
appeared as conquerors and ffaders rather tļļan as serders and immį
grants. It was not the same because one of the predominant themes
during the first phase of conquest and expansion was thar caste-based,
indigenous Indian socrery was ordered, traditional and layered hier-
archically, and should be nurtured and appreciatedin the same way
that rhe similar society in Britain was.r3 This accounts for Burke's
hostility to 'Ųfarren Hastings, whorir he saw as a yrant overturnįn8
and extinguishrng the time-sanctioned social order of the subcontinent
- a much more sympathetic view of nadve peoples from that which he
had taken of rhem on the far side of the Atlantic, where they seemed
merely rootless, savage and unsertled. For Burke, as for many Britons,
the social arrangemenrs in south Asia seemed easily recognizabre and
comfortingly familiar. As Thomas Munro explained in r go5, .the want
due to due gradation of ranks in Society in this Įou.rtry is more
imaginary than real, for what is effected by establishing such a gra-
dation by properry in other parts of the wodd is accomplished here by '

the distinction of casts [sicļ and the manners of the people,.la
From these social analogies and sociological perceptions, various

further consequences followed and flowed. The Britrsh became very
interested in the theory and practice of casre, and in the ways in wliich
they thought Indian sociery resembled their own; and many books

r6
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were written on the subiect at this timė. They also believed that the

standing and status of the native princes at (as rhey saw.it) the top of
this layered hierarchy should be strengthened and supported, and that
they should be treated as social equals. As Sir John Lindsay (himself

the younger son of a peer) had observed, writing from Madras in r77t,
'it is by no means good policy to diminish the consequences of our
friends. on the corftraĪy' by exalting their digniry, we raise our own,

and bind them to our interests'.ls This in turn impliėd _ and here was

the similarity with the settlementcoįonies -that the British proconsular

regime should also be of unprecedented grandeur, in itš spectacle and

its buildings, partly to match the pomp and circumstance of the princely

states, but also to project an image of order and authority, as in the

days of the Marquess Wellesley. lndia, he observed, 'is a country of
splendour, of extravagance, of outward appearanēesį. As such, it must

'be ruled from a palace, not from a counting house; with the ideas of a

prince, not those of a retail dealer in muslins and indigo'.16 Thus
ratĪona|ized and |ustified, imperial hierarchy and its ceremonial projec-

tion reached their zenith in the British Raj, initially in the early nine-

teenth century, and again and more lastingly in the early twentieth.

But they would also provide the models for those crown colonies

that would later be acquired elsewhere in Asia and Africa, both in

terms of governmental structure and social organization. Before the

last quarter of the nineteenth century, Britain only teetered on the edge

of Africa, and had very limited political or commercial relations -
thoughTheophilus Shepstone is credited with pioneering a certain rype

of indirect rule via native Zulu chiefs in Natal in the r 84os.17 And there

were already other indications as to what future attitudes towards

them miģt be. SirJoshua Reynolds's portrait of Omai,,a young South

Sea islander who had visited London in the early r77os and been

lionized in polite sociery, depicted him with the flowing robes, assured

standing and patrician gestures of a confident, traditional native chief.

Omai was also the subject of a play by John O'Keefe, the finale of
which saw him enthroned as king of Tahitr-18 Seventy years later Sir

David \ililkie's portrait of Mehemet Ali, the Egyptian pasha, was to

convey very similar images: a vigorous personality and strong charac-

ter' a great and powerful ruler, who sat on a throne wearing traditionaĮ

r8

3. Omai, by Sir Joshua Reynolds.
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(and forbidden) Egyptian dress, and who sought independence from
the Turks and recognition for his country. And two generations on,
this same view was again articulated by Sir Richard Burron, whose
visits to'Ųfest Africa in the r86os and r88os meant he was fascinated
by what he regarded as the 'barbaric splendours, of the Dahomean
king and his courr- splendours thatwould captivate many subsequent
colonial administrators.le

These were essentially unifuing and hierarchical views of empire, or of
those societies still beyond empire. This was how the British saw their
own society, andpreferred it to be. So it is scarcely sļļĪprising that this
was how they saw other societies too - as approximating more or less
to what thŅ knew (or thouģt they knew) of home. But there were
also important ways in which, from within the metropolis itselĻ this
layered vision of the empire was encouraged, unified and promoted,
so as to make it more coherent and convincing. O_ne such means was
by the codification and extension of the hbnours sysrem into somerhing.
that was a more British, and more imperial, structure of titles and
rewards. The late eighteenth and early nineteenth centuries witnessed
the expansion of the (English) Order of the Garter and the (Scottish)
Order of the Thistle, and the establishment of the (Irish) Order of
St Patrick. The Order of the Bath, founded in 17 z 5to recognize military
prowess at home and abroad, had initially consisted of only thirry-six
kniģts; it was extended and remodelled in r8r5, with three carefully
ranked grades of honour. The Order of St Michael and St George was
set up by Sir Thomas Maitland in r8r8 to massage the self-esteem of
the island gentry of Malta. And there were unprecedented creations of
peerages, as Scottish and Irish nobles wėre given United Kingdom titles,
and as politicians, proconsuls and military men were lavished with
baronies, viscountcies, earldoms, marquessates and dukedoms.2o' The result was the consolit{ation of a pan-British, pan-imperial elite
that conquered and governed, unified and ordered, the empire for the .

fust time. Nor was it coincidence that this period aĮso witnessed a
growing 

"rro"1i"tio., 
between crown ānd empire. By definition, the

British Empire 'was underpinned by the cult of monarchy'.zt The
sovereign was head of the imperial state and of imperial society;

4. Mehemet Ali, by Sir Davrd wiļkie.
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governors ruled and viceroys governed in the monarch,s name; and rife
in the empire, as in the metropolis, was suffused with the substance
and symbolism of royalty. Before they turned against George ĮII, the
American colonies had been very loya| and royal,marking Āorr"..h.,
birthdays, accessions and coronatiorr. ir, 

"pį.opriately festive style
from Massachusetts to the Carolinas., AnJ;s the empire .*n"r,Įd
again in the aftermath of Yorktown, the position of the soveĮign as
its political flywheer, social apex and ceremoniar cyriosure was fu-rther
enhanced. Throughout th e Ī79osthere were royal fi4ework displays in
the't ,est Indies, and patriotic medals were struck with the kinį,s i.ad
on it; there were mass petitions of loyalty from the burģers of Calcutta,
Bombay and Madras; a d in Nova Scotia the proconsular regime of
Governor John t ientworth was embellished by the presence of the
duke of Ke t and the duke of Clarence. The domestic hierarchy of
the British nation, and the overseas hierarchy of the British Empire,
connected and converged on the person of the sovereign, who com-
pleted them and gave them their meaning, coherence and legitimacy.z3

But however plausible it may have seemed to many Britons at home
and overseas, this unified, interconnected, hierarchical picnrre oftheir
empire was never more than a parrial image oi how rhings were, even
at the zenįth of this first great imperial impulse in the late eighteenth
and early nineteenth centuries. In the American colonies, some
lamented that the British social structuĪe had not been fully repli""t d,
a d that there was no''native aristocracy', while others insisted thai
the cult of freedom and independence meant the coronists were .adverse
to subordination, in any outmoded old_world hierarchy _ the view that
finally prevailed after 76.lnlndia, zealots like Bentinck, Macaulay
and Dalhousie, inspired by a confidenr mixture of Ev.angelicalism
and Udlitarianism, thought native rulers corrup, 

"rra 
n*iu. .ustoms

barbaric, and sought to supersede them with western_style law, govern_
ance and education, which would be efficient rather thanr ornar ental.2a
And when they turned their attention elsewhere, there were those like
Raffles (and Palmerston) who thought oriental rule was .despotic,
and needed overturning, and that the governing elites in Africa were
'recalcitra t' and needed reforming.Į

Not surprisingly, then, the metropolitan efforts to complete this
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British imperial hierarchy at the centre and to export it abroad, so as
to forge 'an entire interactive system', were never a complete success.
The American colonists eventually rejected the whole thing outriģt;
aftempts to create a peerage and orders of knighthood to tįe the
Canadians closer to the British did not come off; the governor of
Quebec, Guy Carleton, later Lord Dorchester, opined that it was
'impossible for the- dignity of the throne or peerage to be represented
in the American [i.e. Canadian] forests'; and the national and imperial
apotheosis of George III was scarcely replicated by his rwo scandal-
ridden successors.26 Moreover, although this hierarchicaļ world_view
that was extended across the British Empire was conservative in its
ideology, and strJssed the importance of tradition anįunchangingness,
it was ofteriVery innovativ.e and inventive in its practices. The elaborate,
layered social ordering of the American colonies was, at the mid
eighteenth ce tury, a relatively recent developmenr. The caste system
in South Asia was constantly evolving and mutating, and many of the
ruling princes of India wefe upstarts ratļrer than the representatives of
an unchanging hierarchical order.z1 The honours that were given out
in unprecedented numbers to Britons at home and abroad stressed

chivalry and history, but many of them were novel creations. And
the ceremonial surrounding proconsuls overseas and the monarch in
Britain was at least as ne\Ā/ as it was old.

zz

Nevertheless, it bears repeating that throughout the period of the first
and second British Empires, and culminating in the years from the
Ī79os to the r8zos, there was a powerful and unifying sense of the
empire as the extension oyerseas, or the discovery overseas, of societies
resembling that which existed, or had.existed, in Britain. In the after-
math of the American Revolution, this vast, interconnected, hierarchi-
cal world was especially associated with such men as Pitt, Dundas,
'Wellesley and Macartney. And it provided the precedents and models
for another such high-imperial cabal a century later, in the persons of
Disraeli, Curzon, Milner, Lugard and Churchill, when the British
Empire ..".hįd its peak as an ordered construct and 'traditional'

ji, creadon.28 To be surė, there was something of a lull in the period in
between. \n a Punch sketch of r85o, entitled '\(aiting at rhe Station',
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Thackeray picrures some Britons emigrating to Australia, a d assumes
they will find an undifferentiated community that will contrast strongly
with the old England, .that Gothic socieĘ with its ranks and hier-
archies, its cumbrous ceremonies, its glittering antique paraphernalia,.
Perhaps they did.2e But for the best part of another hundred years,
from the Indian Mutiny o{ fi57 to Indian independence ninery years
later, the rulers and leaders of the British Empire tried to make that
hierarchicaļ structufe happen, and that hierarchical vision convince. It
is time to see how and where they set about it.

i:
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Dominions

Between the mid nineteenth and the mid twentieth-centuries, the four
great dominions šf settlement offered the most substantial scope, either

for the repuUiation or for the replication of the domestic British social
hierarcŅ across the seas into the empire. Įndeed, it would be more

accurate to express this proposition not as'either . . . or', but rather as

'both ... and'. For these were not so much irreconcilable opposites,

between which a stark choice had to Ue made, but aļternative possibili-

ties, which could in practice be embraced simultaneously. On the one

hand, it is widely recognized that the dominions, especially AustraĮia
and New 7,ealand, developed political cultures that were democratic
and liberal, out of which autonomous, post-imperial, multicultural
nations would eventually evolve. But meanwhile they did so in the

comtext of social and ceremo ial cultures that were much more con-

servative and inegalitarian, and that thus fitted comfortably for the

time being into the broader world of the British Empire, a traditional,
monar.chical, reaļm.l And like the thirteen American colonies before

them, the dominions were hierarchical in more senses than one: there

was a hierarchy of race and colour (with which we are by now very

familiar); and, superimposed on top of it, a hierarchy of social starus

and prestige (about which we know rather less).

Following the precedent set by the coloniaļ Americans, the four
settlement dominions were established as essentially'white men's coun-
tries', which meant the enforced disregard and sustained undermining
ofthe'inferiol' indigenors faces: the Indians and Įnuit in Canada, the

Maoris and Aborigines in Australasia, and the'Hottentots'in South
Africa, whose lands were taken, numbers reduced and position

27
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marginalized.2 Įn Canada the native peoples had lost most of their
lands east of the Great Lakes by the lare r 8 3os, and across the sourhern
prairies native ritle was extinguished in the r87os. In Australia it was
an unquesrioned assumption that the British enioyed the sole right to
own and occupy the isļand continent, embodied in the colonlsts, doc-
trine of terra nuĮĮius; and by the late nineteenth century the .white

Austraļia'policy was fully in place. In New Zealand, after annexation
in r 84o, the Treaty of'!Taitangi ostensibly guaranteed the native chiefs,
rights, powers, land and authority; but this was disregarded, as the
Maori were systematically dispossessed of their land, sometimes by
military force, between the r84os and the r86os.ļ And irr British South
Africa, the Xhosa were eiected from their lands in the Cape, and the
ZuĮu f'rorn Natal, while after the Boer 'W'ar, one of the principles on
which the new Union was established was that of the .abando menr
ofthe black races'.a

On the basis of this rigorously enforced racial hierarchy, where chiefs
and tribes were shown far less respect than wouļd be the case elsewhere
in the empire, many whrte British settlers were increasingly concerned
to replicate the layered, ordered, hierarchical society they believed they
had left behind at home. Populations in these 'new' colonies were
generally sparse and scattered, and their economies were primarily
agricultural; this provided substantial scope for the re-creation of
metropolitan landed society overseas. For much of the second quarter

of the nineteenth century, when British agricukure was generally

depressed, and when the pickings from 'Old Corruption' were dwin-
dling, sprigs of nobiliry and distant cousins set off for Canada, New
Zealand and Australia, in the hope they might establsh and enjoy the

sort of genteel life there onwhich they could no longer count in Britain.s
So in New South Wales, figures such as the lrby brothers, nephews of
Lord Boston, and William Chades'Wentworth, a distant relative of
Earl Fitzwilliam, established themselves in the 'First Rank of Society'.
They built country houses, became justrces of the peace, founded the
Australia Club in Sydney, and were much concerned with the trappings
of tradition - duelling, coats of arms, genealogy and pedigrees.6

It was the same elsewhere in the Antipodes, where British models of
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gentilify and hierarchy were energerically replicated and enthusiasti-
calĮyreproduced. InVictoria, South Australia andTasmania, successful
early settlers purchased and extended large estates in the mid-Victorian
period, and the resulting new gentry elites were consoļidated by inter-
marriage and shared ways of life. In the towns, they provided the social
leadership in Melbourne, Adelaide and Hobart; and in the country,
parks and mansio s caļled Panshanger and Clarendon boasted deer
and pheasant and salmon, which provided ample scope for hunting,
shooting and 6shing. Observers marvelled at'well-ordered neighbour-
hoods', where 'the natutal subordinations of society are maintained'.
As Trollope noted approvin g|y inr873,'Īimagine the,life of a Victorian
landowner.is veį much as was that of the English country gentlemarļ
a century dY, ."nrury and a half ago'; rhey were, he felr sure, 'an
established aristocracy with very conservative feelings'.7 The same was
true in New Zealand, where rhe great landowners held estates of well
above 5rooo ācres, engaged in conspicuous leisure and consumption,
cultivated modes of paternalistic bėhaviour, controlled the leading
recreational and cultuial institutions, and constituted what ong-his-
torian has described as a quasifeu da!'ancien rėgime' .8

Across the world in Canada, where hostiliry to the revolution of

76 had been intensified by the war of r8rz, the desire to replicate
and defend a traditionaļ British social structure against the egalitarian,
democratic and republican ethos of the United Stares remained strong.
Like pre-r789 Quebec, pre-ry76 Upper Canada was an extremely
retrograde sociery, controlled by a small clique known as the 'family
compAct', whose members were bound together by'education, social
distinction and conservative tendencies'. They dominated everything,
they delighted in defending the kinģ and the constitution, they gloried
in their imperial ties and connections, and they possessed an exagger-
ated regard for Btitish traditions.e Unlike America, they saw their
šociery as layered, established and stable, and they were preoccupied
with notiohs of rank and ideas of respectability, Indeed, the more in
practice their society came ro resemble that of the neighbouring United
States, the märe the Canadians insisted on seeing it as different, by
stressing what they believed to be rts defining characteristics of hier-
archy and order. It was the same in nearby Newfoundland, where the
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second quarter of the nineteenth century witnessed the development

of a vivid and vigorous colonial culture, centred on pageants, pro-

cessions and ostentatious displays of'dutiful obedience and veneration

of the sovereign'.lo

Underpinning all these mid-century settler regimes, with their tra-

ditional, ffansoceanic loyalties and their 'imported social hierarchies',

was the view, originaĮly pioneered by some Amerįcarr colonists and

carried over into the nineteenth century by many peciple in Britain and

the empire, that a mature settler society was įecessarily a graded,

layered society. That, in essence, was what they were seeking to estab-

lish in these new, far-distant realms: in part by the export of authentic

British aristocrats overseas, who *ould set the .oči"l tor'" and the

social standard; in part by the emulative creation of their own indigen-

ous landed gentry. This was why Edward Gibbon Wakefield urged the

transplanting of a complete cross-section of British society inhis Lettet

from Sydn Ģ8z9), and again in A Vieul of the Art of CoĮonization

(rs+s). This was why the Hon. futhur Hamilpn Gordon, himself a

younger son ofLord Aberdeen, urged that'Īfa good number ofyounger

sons who vegetate in England ri/ere to go out there [i.e. Canada] it

might be useful as forming a sort of aristocracy which is so much

wanted there.'ll And that was why, in his novel The C.tlxtons Ģ8+g)'

Sir Edward Bulwer-Lytton expressed the hope that an aristocracy

would develop in Australia. Far from wishing to reject the stratified

society of the mother country, these pundits and politicians strenuously

recommended its replication in the colonies.

Their social hopes and hierarchical predictions were įn significant

measure fulfilled. Some emigrants, leaving Britain, wanted to re-

establish the domesric social hierarchy they regretted they were leaving

behind, and set out to improve their own place within it (zide Dickens's

Mr Micawber); others, on arrival, wanted to distance themselves from

tļrose fellow travellers whom they considered, in every sense, beneath

them. Hence the verdict of Sir Henry Huntley, governor of Prince

Edward Island, who claimed that'an aristocratic instinct'prevailed

among the people of all the provinces of canada. Hence these words

of sir Roger Therry, who in the r86os noted that 'the various observ-

ances of precedence in New south wales, as in most colonial societies,
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are attended to with great, sometimes ludicrous, precision'. ,social

disttnction is everywhere desiredr' agreed the Sydney Morning HeraĮd.
Aļl these coloniaļ seftlers - determined to replicate what they believed
to be the British social order - shared what Geoffrey Bolton has called
'an Anglican and hierarchical view of society,, which in its ideal form
was'one of village communities, in which an obedient and industrious
tenantry enjoyed the public libraries and mechanics institutes, the
plouģing matches and hospitable spofting events, organized and con-
troļled by the landed gentry'.į2

This 'aristocratic thread', which ran through Britain's new settler
colonies, älso meant a widespread eagerness for honours and hereditary
distinctions: the coping stone, as Burke had long ago rer,narked, of any
established\hierarchical society. In r853 ŅfiįĮiam Charles \ entworth
proposed hereditary, titled legislative councillors in New SoutĮ Vales,
based on the Canadian mo del of rygt,and following a similar scheme
put forward in South Australia four years previously. They'would lay
the foundations of an aristocracy' in the colony by encouraging and
reward.ing the leading local notabļes and would 'necessarily form
one of the strongest inducernents' to British aristocrats to send.their
reļatives overseas.l3 There were also many who shared the view of Sir
Charles Fitzroy that colonial orders of knighthood would ,strengthen

their connėctions with the mother country, by holding up legitimate
objects of ambition to public oflficers and resident gentry'. As colonial
secretary, Lord Bathurst had considered the creation of a separate
Order for Canada in the r8zos, and his successor, Lord-Stanley, took
up the idea again in r844. At the time of Confederation, Lord Monck,
then governor-general, urged the giving of titles for life to members oi-
the new upper house and the creation of an Order of St l^awrence;

and in r88r Lord Lorne once mofe suggested tļre establishment of a
Canadian order to the colonial secrerary. In shorr, dwing the third
quarter of the nineteenth century, the idea that 'the aristocratic element
should form a wide ingredient'in colonial government a d societywas
broadly held.īa

Appropriately enough, these very status-conscious societies were
presided over by qovernors who were by occuparion mimetic monarchs
and by standing men of high status, like Lord Elgin in Canada, and the
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Fitzroy brothers in New Zea?and and New South 'Ų7ales, who were
grandsons of the duke of Grafton. Governors were not only powerful
politicalll,: as the direct, personal representative of the sovereign, rhey
were ar the apex of the colonial social hierarchy, they legidmated and
cornpleted it, and they linked it directly and personally to the monarch
and the mother country. In more senses than one, they literally ordered
society. As the colonial novelist and pundit'Sam Sļick' explained, the
governor was 'the fountain of honour and the distributor of patronage
and rank', by determining who should (and should not) be invited to
Government House.ļ' And they were the cenffe of attendon at those
ceremonials when society put itself on show. Their arrivals, departures
and openings of colonial legislatures were marked with uniforms,
parades, processions, salutes, at which the settler community displayed
itself in ordered, layered procession. And they presided over locaļ
celebrationq (or observances) to mark royal birthdays, coronarions,
jubilees and funeraļs. The result, Mark Francis notes, was .an official
hierarchicaļ society', in which orders of preced.e-nceencompassed every-
one, 'from colonial viceroy almost down to a wood-chopper', just as
they did in an Englrsh county, from the ļord-lieutenant to the agricultu-
ral labourers.ļ6

During the last quarrer of the nineteenth century these layered settler
societies became _ as their suPporters in Britain and overŠeas had
hoped - more marure; mor differentrated and more elaborate. In
Į estein Australia the speaker of the legislature from t886 to r9o1
was James Lee Steers. His father was a fox-hunting backbench British
Tory, who traced his ancestry back to the eleventh century, and he
himself maintarned impeccable traditions of decorum and gentiliry
stĪongly (and self_consciously) suggestive of hrs English country back-
ground. In Melbourne, in 1885, J. A. Froude found ro his delight a
full-blown country house in the Scottish Baronral sryle, set įn its own
park, with two reaļ English lords in it, and a son of the house who had
a 'face that mrght have belonged to Sir Launcelot'.17 It was the same įn
rural Ontario, where 'the local tradespeople and farmers deferred
dutifully to the ļeadership of a better educāted squirearchy, whose
mansions, sometimes with baļlrooms and chapels of their own, domi-

tL
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nated the dįstrict'. And these domestic developments towards a more

layered and established coloniaļ society were reinforced by the arrival

of a new generation of 'gentleman emigrants' from Britain, who were

leaving behind another agricultural depression. In Manitoba, Alberta

and British Columbia, Edward George Everard ffoulkes, the Hon. F. C.

Lascelles and the Hon. Coutts Marjoribanks set themselves up as

farmers and ranchers, with all the accoutrements- of gentility: fox-

hunting, garden parties, cricket and tennis, country houses and family

silver and scores of servants.ls

Froude's reassuring conclusio from visiting Australia was thatthere

v/as now ample room in the coļonies of settlement 'for all sorts and

conditions of men', from the top of the gritiļh social hierarchy to the

bottom, and the result was 'English life all over again: nothing strange,

nothing exotic, nothing new or original'.le And as these societies

became more elaborately differentiated, they also became increasingly

articulated and codified. From Melbourne to Toponto, Sydney to Cape

Town, gentlemen's clubs, grand hotels, railway stations, pubļic

schools, new universities, provincial legislatures and Anglican

cathedrals proliferated during the last quafteĪ of the nineteenth cen-

tury, māny of them constructed in Scottish Baronial or Gothic Revrval

style redolent of history, antiquity, hierarchy and tradition: precisely

the things that Thackeray had hoped would exist but had feared did

not.20 on one sįde of the world this was well illustrated in the Mel-

bourne of the r89os: where the Victoria gentry stiĮl held sway, where

social attitudes were class conscious and hierarchical, and where the

young Robert Gordon Menzies (of whom more later) was growing up.

And the same was true across the Pacific in Vančouver, where a highly

Anglophile and self-consciously stratified society deveĮoped in the

thirry years before the First World 'War, centring on the excļusive

Vancouver Club and the SociaĮ Register.z1

This stratification and Gothicization of the dominions was evident

in other v/ays, as essential works of social reference and prestiSe

ranking extended their coverage from the metropolis to the periphery-

In r83 zJohn Burke had produced the fourth editron ofhi s GenealogicaĮ

and Heraldic Dictionary of the Peerage and Baronetage of the British

Emp ire, which had begun with the appropriately hierarchical sentrment

.i
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that 'the aristocracy of the British Empire, like its other inimitable
institutions, exists but as a ļink in the great chain which connects the
community at large'. Yet for all its mention of .the British Empire,,
Burke was rnerely following contemporary usage and referring to the
'four kingdoms' of England, Ireland, Scotland and r Tales. By the late
nineteenth century, however, this was all to change, as ,the British
Empire' came to mean'tĪansoceanic dominions, and it was towards
these that genealogists now directed their attentiorļ. Berween r89r and
1895 Sir Bernard Burke produced two ļarge, ornate volumes, modelled
on the British Peerage and the Landed Gentry, which described and
codified the CoĮoniaĮ Gentry. The aim was to 'preserve in a convenient
and permanent manner the records of the leading families in the
Colonies' and'to show to those at home and abroad the close bonds
of kinship that unite the sister colonies to one another and the mother
country'.2

In these spacious and expensive pages, whicĘyielded nothing in
pretence to the metrop o|itan Peerage and the Ląnded Gentry,Burke
listed 535 such families. He gave details of their pedigrees, coa$ of
arms and places ofresidence; and provided the dates and circumstances
of their arrival in the colony. Among rhem were Charles Edward
Herbert Orpen of the Cape of Good Hope, whose fa.mily .claims great

antiquity'; Sir James George Lee Steers of Jayes, Blackwood,'W'estern
Australia, whose ancestry could be traced 'without interĪuPtion since

the conquest'; Firzwilliam Ventworth of Vaucluse near Sydney, whose
family'is said by genealogists to have derived its designation in Saxon
times'; Richmond Beetham of Christchurch, Canterbury, New Zea-
land, who claimed descent from King Edward the Elder; and Richard
Tyrwhitt of Nantyr,'W'est GwilĮimbury, Canada,whose forebears had
'been seated foi several centuries in the north of England'. Here was

the ultimate reference booĖ for the hierarchical settler society that the

British dominions had become: some sprigs of British nobility, others

self-established. Most of those incļuded were self-selected, like the

family of Lee Steers, 'because they felt they were entitled to be con-

sidered in some way superior in birth or breeding to the maiority of
their contemporaries'.23

It was scarcely coincidence that, from the last quarter of the nine-
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teenth century, these more differentiated, elaborate and ostentatious

colonial hierarchies were completed and perfected by viceregal regimes

that were not only of unprecedented splendour and magnificence, but
that also.thereby mimicked and reflected the unprecėdented splendour

and magnificence of the newly refurbished British monarchy, as well as

the Indian viceroyalty.za Canada was confederated in 1867, Australia
became a federation in r9oo, New Zealand was declaręd a dominion
in r9o7, and the Union of South Africa was createā in r9ro. These
new nations were srill overwhelmingly British in their social aspirations
and cultural values, and they were presided over by governors-general
who were more lordly, courtly and aristocratic than anything that had
beeh seen in the empire since the r8oos.6 The British believed that the
'colonies were not content unless a person of hiģ rank and remarkable
distinction wäs appointed': 'English gentlemen in the fullest sense of
the word,' who stood for 'all that is august, stable and sedate in
the country'. And there was clearly substantial support for this view
overseas. As Sir william McMilĮan, a well-known Australian conserva-
tive, put it in rgoz: 'Brilliant young men, belonging to the upper classes
in England and, as a rule, taken from the House of Lords,, were now
being appointed to these posts 'because their position as the apex of
our political and social system will be beyond cavil.'

The resultwas an unprecedented efflorescence ofpeers as proconsuls:
Devonshire and Lansdowne in Canada, Dudley and Denman in Aus-
tralia, Ranfurly and Bledisloe in New Zealand, Gladstone and Claren-
don in South Africa, as well as a host of lesser lords in the Australian
states, such as Normanby, Brassey and Hopetoun in Victoria. Marveļ-
lously arrayed with plumed hats, ceremonial swords, ribbons and stars,
and transported in ostentatious luxury in speciaĪ trains, they toured
their dominions, entertained grandly, made speeches and laid founda-
tion stones. As representatives of the queen-empress and king-
emperors, as members of thi House of Lords, as landowners in their
own right, and as the product of the traditional social order of the

British countryside, they were veritable icons of hierarchy: 'high-
minded Christian gentlemeį'with the'charm of a typical āristocrat of
the old country'.27 And they lived an appropriately lordly and viceregal
sryle. 'Everything is done,'observed a visitor ro Lord Carrington when
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he was merely governor of New South 1W-ales, ,just as it wouļd be in a
great country house in England so that it is impossible to realize one is
not in England.' And įhat was precisely the point. In their rank, tlreir
titles and their social lustre, these plumaged figures sent our from the
imperial metropolis served to incorporate individuaļ coloniaļ hier-
archies into the collective hierarchy of empire. As Edward Hamilton
observed, 'big colonies . . . like English noblemen. . . [they] have rather
snob-like tendencies'.28

Meanwhile, the gentlemēn emigrants continued to emigrate, especially
after the First \ o;ld \Var, which witnessed the unprecedented slauģ-
ter of oldeąand younger sons, and also the avalanche of estate sales
that followed.2e The result was that during the rgzos and r93os a new
generation of disaffected patricians, who were further alienated from
the mass urban democracy of Britain, sought to re-create theiĪ leisured,
landed, privileged lives in the White Hiģlands of Kenya, just as
their predecessors had done in Australia and Canada. Men like Lords
Eelamere, Cranworth and Erroll, Lord Francis Scott, Sir Ferdinand
Cavendish-Bentinck and Sir Jock Delves Broughton acquired large
holdings of land, built great houses, installed the family paintings and
siĮver, and treated their coloured labourers in the same way that their
forebears had treated their servants back home. As Lord Deļamere,s
biographer notes, 'the feudal systēm was in his bones and blood, and
he believed all his tife in its fundamental rightness,l and it was this
system that he and others sought to perpetuare and preserve in the
empire. Appropriately enough, they found their celebrant and apologist
in the young Evelyn ITdugh, who acclaimed their efforts .to transplant
and perpetuate a habit of life traditional to themselves which Enģand
has ceased to accommodate - the traditional life of the English squi-
rearchy'.30
' In 1873 AntĮrony Trollope had contrasted the social strucrure of
Britain, which he thought to be traditional-hierarchical, with that of
the United States, which he considered democratic-egalitarian. And
from this starting point, he concluded (with relief ) thar .the colonies
are rather a repetitiÖn of England than an imitation of America,.3l In
this he was generally correcr, and the observarion continued to hold
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good for the next half century and more, even beyond the inter_waryears. Gentlemen emigrants, combined with colonial 
"rpi."n,., ".rātopped off with proconsular rŅmes of signal grandeur, meant thatthe dominions of settlement (and settlers' Į..ry"; were far more tra-ditionalist in their afti des than were,h" U;iį.į r"*ĮffiĮ;.

They had had their anti-royal, antįdtle, anti-įietarchy revolution in1776;the dominions desired no such ruPture. rr'.r*rri, Į;ä;towards greater democracy and political freedo , but socially, cul_turally and, significantĮy, economically, they remained in thrall to aceftain vision of the mother country: ,o *Ļ"a Geoffrey Bolton hascalled 'the titles, the veneration of landed estates, the hierarchicar
atritudes, the myth of gracious living,. They did ,";*;;;;;_
itarian-American; they preferred .i*itrtio., 

".rd 
deference,, il ;;proud and happy to keep their social disrinctions, their ui"...g"l .orĮ,and thus to remain part of traditional, Greater Britain..,

-

In social terms, the Bridsh coronies of settrement were about the export
oj 

|,...-.f,r, 
India, by conrrasr, was much more abour the analoguesof hierarchĻ. Or, rather5 it' became increasingly about them in thesecond half of the nineteenth century. After the Muginy of 1857, tĮeBentinck-Macaulay-Dalhousie policy (and stereorype) of overrurnrng

the corrupt, despotic, ruling regimes that they had believed India to bewas largely given up. This was replaced by th. 
"lt.r.r"tive 

policy (and
the alternative stereotype) that regarded įhe established order muchmore favourably, and as something thatpught to be promoted andpreserved''Traditional','timeļess' and'unchanging, South Asia now
became an object to cherish rather than to criticize: .once 

the targer ofreformers, India had now become the hope of reactionaries,.i Butlndia
was a large and complex country _ an entrre subcontinent populated
by teeming millions embracing two powerfut 

".ra.o*p.,i"#;;;There were territories directly admi.ri.te."d by the British, which wereruled from Calcutta (and later from New Delhi), and there werebe veen five and six hundred autonomous princely states, which con_stituted rouģly one third of the subcontiient. How, in the decades
after the Mutiny, did the British re-envisage (and re-estabrish) this mosrresonant and romantic part of their empire, ,ordering into a singlehierarchy all its subjects, Indianand ritish alike,?z

one way in which they did so was by givļng more aftention to theconcepts and categories of caste- During the closing de..a.. or tn ,uį.rro.l"::.!dia Co1nlanl, the trrahmįic theory of caste had become
more rtgtdifĪed, and its influence spread into areas ran8įng from the
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Īitual Practices ofSouth Indian temples to the honours syjtem oflndian
princes. As such, and further instrumentali zed by the courts, caste
penetrared deep into South Asian sociefy, restructuring the re.lations
of pubiic worship, physical mobility, marriage and inheritance. Jhe
result.was an immobile, status-bound, increasingly incļusive vision of
the Indian social order, which in the second half of the nineteenth
century became even moĪe at active to the Britishthan in the years of
the Company. Beginning with .their own forms of knowledge and
thinking', they came to ļook uPon caste as .the essentiaļ feature of the
Īndian sociaļ system', as the analogue to their oryn carefully ranked
domestic status hierarchy, which seemed to make Indian society
familiar. By t gor caste v/as used in the Indian ce sus as the equivalent
to the social categories used in Britain.3 Thus regarded, India seemed
to the British to be an integrated and coherent hierarchy, with an
'accepted order of social precedence' that they could grasp and under-
stand. 'under British rule,' susan Bayly notes, 'more of the subconti-
nent's peoples than ever before found themselves drawn or coerced
into the schemes of rituaļized social hierarchy which are now regarded
as key characteristics of caste society.,a

caste, and the censuses making caste 'official', gave the British an
aggregative overview oflndian society as layered and traditio al. But
the particular, localized form that this sociery took was the .vilage
community'. In tandem with the rise of caste, the cult of Īhe country
settlement was developing during the last decades of the East India
Company, and it too reached its climax during the second half of the
nineteenth century, when writers such as Sir Henry Maine, Sir Ī7illiam
Ņ7ilson Hunter and Sir Alfred Lyall, taking up and embellishing the
commonplace vrew, praised the Indian village as .ancient,, .organic,,

'complex' and built on unwriffen custom. These 'healthy agricultural
communities' were the essence of 'the existing sociaļ and economic
order', and as such they constituted the primordial unit of ,real,,

'traditional' and 'timeless' India.s As a microcosm of Indian society,
they were by definition hierarchical: ,in every village', philip Mason
recalls, 'there would be people who owed someone else allegiance . . .

everyone you spoke to in a village fitted somewhere into this pattern,.
This vision - the very. image of India that Kipling and other writers
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evoked, celebrated and popularized _ was not c'ing 
to the British 

"nĮ " 
k.r.o*ponentof the,.'l,'ä::'rT:1ļĪ::ļ:1:

irs era of greatest popurariry occurred at exactry the same il;iligrowing cult of the village in the imperial metropolis *,o" ;._il;
the very essence of .Englishness,. 

This was not coinciden.., 
"".. "ĮJrĮit was analogical sociology at work.6

It was atop rhis layered, Burkeian, agrarianimage of Indian society
that the British constructed a system of government that was simuļ-
taneously direct and indirect, authoritarian and coilaborationist, but
that always t.ook for granted the reinforcement and preservation of
tradition and hierarchy. The imperial presence, in the two thirds of the
c-ountry direcdy ruled, took rhe form of a fixed official order. As Kipring
himself once observed, mules, horses and elephants oleyea Įireii
drivers, who in turn obeyed their sergeants, whoĮbeyed,. .į t.rr.i_
ants, who obeyed their captains, who obeyed theirmajors, who obeyed
their colonels, who obeyed their brigadiers, who obeyed their geneĮls,
who obeyed their viceroy. And what was rrue of the military was no
less true of civilians. They were in a parallel chain that tied together
the Indian civil Service, and that extended.from the district officer of
the village, to the govemor of the province, and finally to the viceroy
of all India. Throughout the Raj, protocol was suictly governed by thĮ
'warrant of precedence,, which .in rggr consisted of seventy_seven
ranks, and which gave essentiar advice as to whether the government
astronomer in Madras was of hģer standing than the superintendent
of the Royal Bota icar Gardens in carcutta. Everywhere in British
Įndia, social rank depended on official position. These were, as one of
Paul Scott's characters observes, the .rigid levels of hierarchy, for which
the Raj was renowned. .British Įndia,, Philip Mason rightly recalls,
'was as much infected by caste as Indian India.'7

Įfhen it came to the implementation of justice and the collection
of revenue, the Raj needed dependable allies, and they were chosen
on the assumption that the preferred modeļ of metropolitan society
could be applied to India and anarogized back. For just as British
local government had always depended on the resident aristocracy
and gentry, so thėir chosen PaĪtners in South Asia were the .nafural
leaders': large landowners, men of .property 

and rank,, of .power and
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importance', who 'exercised great influence, in rural socieŅ. As the
British saw them, Indian landļords v/ere to fulfiļ the assigned role
of English notables, because they possessed uaditionar status and
authority in the locarities that made their participarion in the impgrial
enterPrise both vaļuable and reliable.8 The Taļukdars in the United
Provinces, with their landed esrates, or the pirs of Sind, wielding
religious, social and economic influence, were sighificant examples i
the sort of people philip Mason revealingly calls .landown 

ers because
that is the nearest EngĮisb equiuaĮent'.And this was the abiding British
image of South Asia until the end: gentry leader-s of a castį-bound
society' 'Ų.hen governor'of the United Provinces in the late r9zos, Sir
Malcolm Hailey likened the zemindars to the British ,.i.to..r.y 

"rrdsupported them on this basis, hoping that each 3right 
.create for hĻse

the posrtion which was once occupied by the Įld_fashioned squire in
English village life,.e

The remaining third of India consisted of the princely states, those
5oo-odd personal fiefdoms ruled over by rajasand maharajas, nawabs
and nizams, which after rg57 were no longer reviled as alien and
corrupt, but acclaimed as famiļiar and traditional. .The policy of
suppressing, or suffering to go to ruin, all the aristocracy and gentry
of India, is a mistake,' opined Sir Charles 

-Wood, 
the secretary oi.r"rļ

for India in the aftermath of the Mutiny. During his period of office, it
was pur promptly into reverse, as criticism was replaced by cerebration,
disruption by preservation.,0 Hence eueen Victoria,s proclamation of
November 1858, which undertook on behalf of the imperial govern_
ment ro 'respect the rights, digniry and honour of native princes as our
own', because they were the quintessential .natural leaders, of south
Asian sociery. They were to be atrached directly to the British crown;
there were to be no further annexationsl and they were reassured that
on tļre failure of natural heirs, the adoption of a successor would be
recognized.ļ1 The result, as David Washbrook explains, was that.in
social terms'the British Raj was now .happiest dealing with what it
conceived to be a feudal social order. . . ofinherited social hierarchy,.l2

Put more positively, this meant the British resolved to rule one third
of India indirectly through the princes, and through the .deeply rooted
hierarchlcal social structure' of which they were both the expression
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and the apogee.13 As nominallyautonomous .native states,, they admin_
istered themselves under British paramountcy, with residents from the
Indian Political service assigned to them as advisers. They were outside
the government of India's tax base; their autocratjc character insuĮated
them from nadonalist agitation; and they contributed substantiaįy to
the Indian Army. They were carefully ranked and ordered, they were
obsessed with protocol and the numbēr of guns they received in salute,
and they delighted in .flamboyant assertions of ritual sovereignry and
extravagant contests for symbolic precedence'.1a They seemed, then,
just like the ĘĮ,itish aristocracy and gentry; and so it was scarcely
surprising that in t893 and rgoo Sir Roper Lethbridge published
his two editions of The GoĮden Book of Įndia: A GeneaĮogicaĮ and
Biographical Dictionary d tbe "ī')' in:žr, cl,rr1r' Nobļes and
otber Persotages, TitĮed or Decorated, of the Indian Ėmpte.Appro-
priately enough, the.author was a Devon country gentleman, who had
served in the Bengal Education Service earļier i his career and been
Conservative MP for North Kensington between rgg5 and rggz.He
dedicated this work to .Her Most Gracious Majesty Vicroria,'qrr...,
Empress of India', and the result, accord ing to Tbe Times,was .prob_

ably destined to take rank as the recognize d Peerage of Įndia,.15

This view of the 'basic structĮļĪes of Indran society', as caste-ridden,
village-living and princelyJed, became the conventional British wisdbm
in the decades immediately äfter the Mutiny, and as the last quarter of
the nineteenth century opened; it was more deliberately encouraged
and energetically projected.r6 Here, as so ofren was the case with the
hierarchical flowering and Gothic efflorescence of empire, Benjamin
Disraeli was a cruciaļ figure. For it was hc who, as prime minister,
passed the Imperia'l Titles Act m rgT6,which declared eueen Victoria
to be empress of India. This audacious appropriation co soridated and
completed the Brrtish-Indian hierarchy, as the queen herself replaced
the defuncr Mughal emperor at the summit of the sociar order: she was
now an eastefn Potentate as well as a wesįern sovereign. As a result,
and following the precedent and example of the Irish viceroyalty in
Dublin, the position of her representative was ceremonially inflated
and extravagantly enhanced. Thereafter, an lndian viceroys wourd be
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Peers, and their courtly regimes in Calcutta and at Simla, which in turn
provided the models for the governors-general of the great dominions,
would far surPass anything to be seen at Buckinģam Palace or'!find-
sor Castle, where, as Lady Reading noted, things were .simple in
comparison'with alļ this 'show and glitter'.17

The first climax of what J. P. I7aģorne calls this new .culture of
oĪnamentation' was the proclamation of the queen as empress of
India by the viceroy, Lord Lytton, at the 8Īeāt durbar (or .imperial

assemblage') of fi77. As the son of the novelist who had Gothicized
Knebworth House in Hertfordshire, Lytton was the ideal impresario
for this Disraeļian exįra1Į^ganza. After much planning, he selected an
historic site just outside Delhi, the old Mughal capital, construced
a temPorary city of tents and canvas, and wittaĮn a purpose-built
amphitheatre, decorated with banners, coats uir.., and .bits of
buniing', staged a spectacular display of pageantry, rulership and
homage, which made 'manifest and compelling the sociology of India,
and which was mimicked and replicated throuįhout the country. From
one perspective, this represented the successful appropriation of the
indigenous, South Asian symbolic form of the durbar, or ceremoniar
meeting between rulers and ruled, which articulated the traditional
social order and legitimated the position of the queen-empress ar rhe
head of it. But it was also an improvised, pseudo-medieval spectacular
of rank and inequality, which indicated that the British were developing
in India 'a more closely defined honorific hierarchy' and increasingry
projecting an image of their south Asian empire as a 'feudal order,.
Appropriately enough, special emphasis was placed upon the role
of the ruling princes, who were hailed and presented as the .native

aristocracy of the country', and 'whose sympathy and cordial allegi-
ance' was regarded as 'no inconsiderable guarentee for the stability of
the Indian Empire'.18

Thereafter, their cuļtivation as the most favoured (and most orna_
mental) side of the Rai conrinued apace, as the traditional riruals of
princely instaĮlation, local durbars and municipal addresses, which
were invariably attended by senior proconsuls and sometimes even
by the viceroy himself, moved into much higher gear.le Vrith their
confidence (and their incomes) increased, many princes spent fortunes
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building new-ord paraces in 'Indo-saracenrc'sryle, such as LakshmiViļas Paļace in Baroda, designed by l"r"j* cr,arles Mant and RobertFeļļowes Chisholm' and the La,lĻrh iļi^r, 
^rBikaner, for whichSamucl Swinton Jacob was the ,.Ä'*.a ti... *.rt flamboyant corļ-fections' wtth turrets, dornes, o"",į;.;";; towers, atavistic in theircuļturaļ resonances, arrd redoļent or *.ro.rui,)r, order and ffadition.2.As a viceroy with a s

wasespeciall,.".,,iĮ:įT::1lT1fi 
;11*J::.,*ļ3 j,i:įį:

il"r;]:r'l'Tr:*,.:,",o 
oe levelting tenJl"į,.. or*. 

"g.,, 
k.p, t-iiĮ

extinction,,r"o,.,,i,ffi ':T::jļ j::]xJ',T;r1l.. j:;1rl1i
durbar of t9o3, for the King_Empero. aį*"* VII, which far sur- -]passed Lord Lymon's rn splendour and magnificenpe, Curzon gave theprinces a rnuch more acdve role than,r,.Įira ģoyed in 1877. Asparticipants, payļng n:*:*: to the king-eĻp..o. in an amphitheatrespecially designed in the Indo-S"."."niĮ..rĖl, Swinton Jacob, theywerc no longer mereĮy 'architecįural 

"dorn*"nt, of the imperial edi-fice', bur were regarded by the .rrl..roy 

". 
,pil"r. 

,h", help to sustainthe main roof '.2r

This was an apr meraphor, for the British were as busy in theirbuilding at this time as the Indian p.in..r. ana in the main, they didso in the same sty'le: lndo-Sa.r..ni. įhi.h, i, iį, "*r "rrnt 
asymmetriesand its aura of instant antiquity, *r, u.., ,nįn ,*r. spirit and vaĮuesof the Gothrc Revivaļ t rr,į.^.r..l .^ ,-'r;_ 

*;

palaceswereoriental,,.:';::ffi"' j,Į,'jji;i'jj::.*įi"ffi 
ffi:;or'Ųfindsor Castles, so the Victori" T..*i*. 

"t 
Bombay, the HighCourt at Hyderabad and the University 

", 
Or"Oo. were.ex avaganrextensions or reworkings of similar buildlng. in London or Torontoor Melbourne.zz InIndia,as elsewhere i., th?Ļpi.. , privatepalacesand public buildings, however recently constructed, projected a simiļarvisron of impe.al .society 

as unified, venerable, time_honoured andhIerarchrcal' Sometimes this was ļiteralty ro, ,. i,r rt. case of the Gothiccļock tower of Bombay University, *hi.h ho,rr.d *.;;;;;r;#;
repĪesentrng rhe castes of western India. And thir
not only arįiculated b*h.;;ä;#."";j:li ilTj:tr:architccts: by men like Henry lrwin, who a.rigĮĮ ,h. Vt";;i;;;;

ą8

9. ThC maharaja of Mysore's palace at Bangalore.



at Simla and the Madras Law courts, and also the Amba viras palace
for the fabulously rich maharaja of Mysore.23 Here was powerful visual
evidence of the shared commitment of the Raj a d the princes to
hierarchy and order and antiquity and tradition, as well as of the
former's inclination to treat the latter as social equals.

These cumulatively conservative developmenrs - sociological, politi-
cal, ceremonial and architectural - aie well illusrated in the case of
the maharajas of Jaipur, Ram Singh (r85r-8o) and Madho Sinģ
(r88o-r9zz). both rich and both regarded by the British as modeļ
princes. 

|uring tĮe last two decades of his rule, Ram Singh established
a collegeį school of art; a public library, a hospital (named after Lord
Mayo,the assassinated viceroy) and laid out a public garden. He also
built a gasworks, provided piped water in the city, invested in irrigation
and road-building projects, and initiated the washing of Jaipur,s build-
ings, which gained it the title of the pink City. But the centrepiece of
these projects was a museum called the Albert Hall, in honour df the
prince of 'Ų7ales, which was constructed in elaborate Indo-Saracerric
style from designs by Syinton Jacob. In tļe next generation Madho
Singh was, like his predecessor, a Hindu and a.conservative who
prided himseļf on his loyalty to the British arrd on his reputation as a
'progressive''ruler. In order to accommodate his manyvisitors, he built
a European guest house and a ceremonial reception haļl in the outer
courtyard of his city palace, both again designed by Swinton JacÖb,
who was employed in Jaipur for the best part of halt a century.za

This image of India protected and projected by the Raj - glittering
and ceremonial, layered'and traditional, princely and rural, Gothic and
Indo-saracenic - reached what has rightly been called its 'eraborative
zenith' at the Cofonation Durbar of' tgrrwhėn, at his own insistence,
the King-Emperor George V appeared in person with a newly made
imperial crown, thereby surpassing even Curzon,s extravaganza of
Ī9o3.25 The planning was exceptionally elaborate and, as KennetĻ
Rose notes, 'students of the viceregal correspondence which passed
between Calcutta.and London throughout rgrr might suppose that
the British Raj deģended less on justice and good administration than
on precedence, honours and minute disrinctions of dress'. So they
might: for so, in many ways, it did. The king and queen duly arrived
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Įl. King George V and Queen Mary leaving the Durbar throne
after their imperial coronation, Ī9r ļ.

rz. King George V and Queen Mary at the Gateway of Indra, r9r r.
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at Bombay in December, where their landing Ļ". .o*-.*orated bythe Gateway of India, one of the rast Indo-s"aracenic creations of theRaj' They journeyed to Delhi, where a canvas city had been consffucted,accommodating people in strict order of social precedence, 
"b;;;;pavilions, a reviewing ground and an amphitheatre; and there theyresided, among princes, governofs, heraldsr,t-roops and escorts, andrwo hundred thousand visitors. They made įh.i, ro..rr"l state entry ina five-mile long procession, and th.y lrt", Ļrr.a i full coronationfinery to receive the homage of the prince- Ļ *"" įļ r.,;;;#;

with rare effusiveness, .the most beautiful and,wonderful sight I eversaw'.26

Thus cultivated and encouraged, th. r"*rb3"nd the maharajas gavegenerously to the imperial war effort in terms or *or", ""į;;;,;;in r9r8 theywereprobablyat rhepeak of theirpower andprestige. Theking-emperor reaffirmed the 'invioļate and invioļable, commitment ofhis grandmother, describing the ruling priĮ. u, those .whose 
exist-

ence and security is so closely bound ,pĮr *"t or rr,Į .#;;;.;:
In the same way, senior administratįrs, such es Sir Harcourt Butlerand Sir Malcolm Hailey, acclaimed them as the embodiment of ,the
sacred fires of an age-long ftadition,.z7 Throuģout the r9zos andr93os the British aimed to .call in the old world to balance the new,by utilizing them as a counterpoise to the urban nadonalists of theCongress Party. They were given their owĪr seParete chambef that wasinaugurated (with aPpropriate pomp 

"nd 
.į.-o., ial) in ryzr, and

thelwere 
offered a major part in the federal sffucure proposed under

the Government of Īndia Act of r935. They h"d ,r.uļ. į;;-rt.Ļ
they spent fortunes on palaces and i.įĮ..y, rrra (in more enlightened
cases) on their subjects'welfare: pearls and rubies from Cartier įn Parisand London, and hospitals and universiries in Hyderabad. Far from
being the bearers and wearers of hollow crowns, they were stillregarded by the British as .the natural ļeaders of Įndiän .".tį"" 

"""

.Consider, 
in this regard (as Paul Scott miģt have said), ]r4rro..,

which the British looked on as one of the 'Ädel states, .i o.rr""l,India, responsibly run on progressive lines. By the inter_war years, themaharajas of Mysore were second only to the nizams of Hyderabad in
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terms of wealth, with an income in excess of two million pounds a
yeaĪ, some of which was spent on the construction of the Lalit Mahaļ
Palace, an extraordi ary architectural fantasy just outside Mysore city,
modelled on st Paul's cathedral in London. But the maharajas were
also generous to their subjects, founding and funding hospitals,
schools, medical colleges and universities, and vigorously promoting
the beautification of Mysore and Bangarore cities. They pioneered the
provision of electricity (Bangalore was thus iļluminated before Caļcuta
and Bombāy) and promoted representative assemblies.29 At the same
time, tĮrey continued to function as the centre and cynosure of the
ceremonial life of their state. Every year, during the Dasara Durbar,
the city of Mysore put itself on show, with a formal gathering and
homage at the. Amba Vilas palace, followed by a magnifcenr pro-
cession, complete with flags, arches, bands, troops, standards, palan_
quins and caparisoned elephants, with the maharaja and his family
clad in their most gorgeous costumes, and with the British residenįs
keeping a discreet distance. Between r 9 1 4 and r94 5 these proceedings
were vividly preserved in a series of murals in Amba vilas palace, and
the rituals they recorded continued beyond the Second W'orld War.io

Meanwhile, the Raj continued no ress ostentatiously ornamental. As
so often in India, it was the British buildings that sent out this message
most clearly, especially the newly creared capital of New Delhi, the
construction of which George v had announced and authorized at
the rgrr durbar. For, as conceived by Baker and Lutyens, it embodied
the British sociology of India and its obsession with what philip Davies
calls 'hierarchy, status a d rank' as accurately as, and more perma_
nently than, the ordered and rituaļized choreography of the three
great durbars. The Viceroy's House was a ducaļ domain-cum-country
house-cum-princely palace, measuring six hundred feet from end to
end, and one hundred and eiģty feet to the top of the dome of the
Durbar Haļl.3l There were great residences for the ruling princes that
mimicked Mayfair and Park Lane and PiccadiĮly, just as their Indo-
Saracenic palaced in the countryside mimicked Whig mansions. And
the houses of the British officials were clustered in'physical and spatial
forms'.t}tat reflected and reinforced the 'deferential sociaļ hierarchy' of
the Raj: a bungalow for agazettedofficer being altogether superior in
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size and location to that of a Cļass I Married European Clerk. Truly,New Deļhi was a city for the Raj: much liked Į
the civil service 

".,a 
ta. princes. Not for ".,"'Į;:::"iff.'J.'il::::to Lord Lytton,s daughter; and in synthesizing the 

"r.t 
it ..rr"t .ryĮ.of east and west in a post Indo_Saracenic mode, he produced a monu_ment to imperiar hierarchy and social order that was, in Robert Byron,sphrase,'a slap in the face of the modern 

"u..äg. 
Ī an,.32

Of course, inter_war India was in some *"y, 
" 

changing place, aspolitical reforms brought the 'Ind.ianization' of the civiļ service and thebegtnnings of demočracy, and as society became more secular and thetowns more industriaļ''But for the British, modernized India neverattained the allure of the traditional India oflhe mahar"j.. ,.ra J.Raj, of what Bernard S. Cohn called ,order, 
deference and hierarchy,.This, for the British, remained the real, on"h"nging, timeless India. So,when Lord Halifax paid viceregal ,risits to .r.rliog p.in".s, he yielded

nothing in magnificence to Lord Curzon, travelling in a special whiteof'cial train of twerve coaches rhar was more splendid than that of theemperor of Russia, and with a guard of honou. standing stiffly toatcendon all along the ļine.33 In the hands of such Prestige-corļsciousviceroys as Lords Willingdon and Linlithgow, New Deļhi was thesetting for the grandest living on earth, with mor. bo*i.rg 
".rdcurtseying, more precedence and protocol, than anywhere else in theempire, London incĮuded' At its peak in the r93os Viceroy,s Houseemployed a staff of six thousand servants, and they *.r. 

". 
.".ef,rlĻgraded and ranked berow stairs as the officiardom and princes of theRaj were above. And this ordered and ornamented iegime was stillmimicked (and competed with) throughout both princery and officiarIndia. The future King Edward VIII oįce remarked that he had neverknown what authentic regal pomp teally meant until he had stayedwith Lord Lloyd. And Lloyd was nor the viceroy but merely thegovernor of Bombay!3a

į-or the British in India, and for their friends, allies and collaborators,
hierarchy was indeed .the axis around which everything turned,. Thesame could, of course, be saįd of Britain' and this was scarcely coincįdence. Perhaps that was why.India exercised such an appeal for so long
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to the romantic, Disraelian side of the British imagination. As the late
nineteenth century drew on into the early twentieth, and again in the
unstable inter-war years, India's was a hierarchy that became the more
alluring because it seemed ro represent an ordering of sociery - based
on whar Lord Lytton called ,birth, rank and hereditary influence, _
that perpetuated overseas something important that was increasingly
under threat in Britain. As Francis Hutchins observes, .India seemed
to offer th.e prospect of aristocratic security at a time when England
[slc] iqself was falling prey ro democraric vulgariry.'3s As such, this
contemporary vision of 'timeless' India also represented Britain,s better
(but vanishing) past to itselį and seemed to hold out the prospect that
this treasured yet threatened sociery sti[ had a future overseas. .The

India of the Raj', Thomas Metcalf notes, .srood forth as a model, not
only for the empire, but for Britain itseļf.' The interests of those within
metropolitan society who were dissatisfied with their own industial-
urban-democratic order were better served by what they regarded as
the splendid, traditional hierarchies that still flourished east of suez.36

{11



By the time the British came to annex large parts of Africa and of Asia
beyond India during the last quarter of the nineęenth century, and to
administer them in the years down to the Second l7orld .Ųfar, 

the
impulses towards an integrated, hierarchical empire were everywhere
at their zenith, surpassing in their range and their reach th" _"ny
precedents set in the era of piti and Wellesley a century before. In some
ways that were different, but in others that were similar, the dominions
of settlement and the Indian Empire were seen as replicating and
reinforcing the layered, time-hallowed social order of tlre metrįolis.
Proconsuls like Lansdowne, Dufferin and Minto moved back and forth
from Canada to India, taking their plumes and their feathers with
them; young Indian princes were senr to British public schools, and
their parents fēted by British aristocrats; and colonial gentry in the
settler dominions sent their sons to oxford and cambridge, and were
themselves presented at courr.l In the dominions and in rndra, procon-
sular splendour and layered societies were the conveirtionaļ Burkeian
wisdoms and customary conservative modes; and as the .Scramble for
Africa' (and parts of Asia) began, there were soon signs they would be
followed and replicated in the new tropical empire that was rapidly
being acquired.

Since the British would govern these colonies but (in the main) not
settle them, the princely states of rhe Indian Empire provided a more
immediately applicable model than the great dominions, both in terms
of how these native societies were regarded, and in terms of how they
should be administered. coilaboration, rarher than marginalization,
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was to be the prevaihng mode of management. Respect for traditional
tribal structures and support for those rulers who headed them were
early on established as the ways to appreciate and to govern this new
imperium. One indication of this was in Malaya, where the Pangkor
Treaty of t874 was the 6rst in a series negotiated by the British in the
years before r9r4. ln each case, the sultans of the protected Malay
states accepted British residents, or.advisers, on the Indian pattern.
These agreemėnts confirmed the sovereignty of the Malay rulers and
stresse{ the monarchical nature of their regimes, while oblŅng them
to follotv the advice of the British residents in all matters save religion
and custom. The residents helped the sultans improve their finances
and elevated their authority over lesser chiefs. These arrangements
(which were extended to Brunei in r9o5 to 19o6) remained essentially
unaltered until the Japanese invasion in r94r.2

In the same year that the Malay rulers accepted British residents, the
British annexed Fifi, and the Hon. Arthur Hamilton Gordon was
installed as govemor. He negotiated a treaty with King Cakobau,
which protected Fijian lands from the sorr of dispossession that had
takėn place in Australia and New Zcaland,,and which codified chiefly
authority and entrenched aristocracy as the established order through
which the British would govern indirectly. Gordon ly:s the yoįtļįger
son of the earl of Aberdeen (we have already met him urģng tĮre need

to replicate the full British social order in Canada), and he had no
doubt that he was dealing with people of his own social level. He
learned Fijian so hę could address the chiefs in their own language, and
he regarded the purpose of British conrrol as one of safeguarding the
traditional social order and preserving the raditional way of life.3

Gordon's wife was of the same opinion. She thought the native, high-
ranking Fijians 'such an undoubted aristocracy'. 'Their manners,' she

continuęd, 'are so perfectly easy and well bred . . . Nurse can't under_

stand it at all, she looks down on them as an inferior race. I don't like
to tell her that these ladies are my equals, which she is not!: Later in
his career, Gord6n became governor of Ceylon, where he carried
out the same policies, treating the high-born members of the island's
Goyigma caste as 'traditional' aristocracy, whom he vested with power
as paramount chiefs. Again, he sought'to preseĪve' as long as possible,
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a system which enlists all natural ļocal influences in support of
authoriry'.4

As the pace of the scramble for Afrįca accelerated, this mode of
administration, relyrng on indigenous hierarchies, and cultivating and
supporting the native rulers at the top of them, became the obvious
way for the Brirish to govern the vast new areas of land they were
suddenly acquiring - in a fit of absertce of resources, if not necessarily
of absence. of mrnd. In Ī est Africa, Sir George Goldle believed that
'the ge eral policy of ruling throuģ native rulers on African principles
must bēfollowed'.'Agreat chieĻ'as Claude Macdonald, the governor
of Lagos, put it in r9o4, 'rs a very valuablc possession; his authoriry is
an inrstrumenr of the greatest public utilrty, which rt is most desirable to
retain in full force." In the Sudan, the Anglo-Egyprian adminisrration
established after 1898 ļooked to the Indian princely states and the
Malayan residents system for precedents, and soon began .to sįļpPort
the suĮtans and sheikhs in therr dealings with their own subjects'. In
Kenya, local government through the chiefs was estabhshed between
r9or and r9rz, especiaĮly among the Kikuyu. In Uganda, the chiefs
and regents of Buganda continued to govern, subject to their traditional
sovereign, the kabaka, and the Britrsh ruled through him and through
them. And a simiļar system operated in southern Africa,ivhere Bechu-
analand, Basutoland and Swaziland were governed indirectly by the
Britrsh through kings, chiefs and tribes.6

If Joseph Chamberlain had had his way during his years as colonial
secretary (r895-r9o3), the traditional policies that had emerged in
Malaya and Fiii, and that were now being replicared across British
Africa, would have been put abruptly into reverse. He might now be
t'he Unionist colleague of Salisbury and Balfour, bur in some ways
Chamberlain remairred the radicaļ hater of 'hierarchy he had bee as
Birmingham's mayor and a Liberal MP. Like an earlier generation of
reformers in India, he wanted to intervene aggressrvely in the new
coļonies that were his responsibility, and to overthrow the inīigenous
rulers because t ey were unequal to the tasks of mod,ernization and
development that he wished to carry out.7 But this policy was neirher
popularnor permanent. There was African resisrance to such disruptive
intervention, as with the Sierra Leone rebellion of fi97 to rg9g. In an
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13. King Cakobau III doing homage ro the governor of.Fiji, 1953.
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era when revelarions of malpracdces in the Belgian Congo were raisinghumanitarian consciousness, there was also public disquiet. And therewas resistance to such radical.interventions on the part of the CoļonialOffice staff. Accordingly, Chamberlain,s policy was put into reverse,and the colonial secretary recognized that ,the agency of the nativechiefs, was to be relied upon in future: reform would be given up,' discontent would be avoided, African consänt *orļd be secured, andgoverĪįment wouļd be through indigenous hierarchies. .No p"inrjChamberļain observed of the Malayį .olt"rr. in words that becameequally applicable to African chiefs,'should be spared to safeguard theposition and dignity of Native Rulers.,8
It was in this corrtext that the preservätion of traditional localrulers and rļative society became accepted after t9doas the preferred

technique of management in Britain,s new colonial empire. Therewas nothing originar about ie but Lord Lugard,s imprementation of'indirect rule'in Nigeria (which o*.d ro-"th-ing to the Indian princery
states, and something to the residentiaį system in Malaya) was soonacknowledged as the most important and influential *;;į,;;r*;
Africa.e From rgoo to :9o6 he was high commissioner of Norther
Nigeria, a vast area that he had to admįister with a small staff and aIimited budget' But he was enthra,led by the splendour of the Musļim
ruling chiefs, and impressed by the order and efficiency of their adminis-
trations' So he resorved 'to retain the native authority and to workthrough and by the native emirs', with British residenrs dury installed
to advise them' But he arways insisted that 'native chiefs have crearly
defined duties and an acknowledged status, equaĮly with the British
of6ciaĮs'' Lugard later retuĪned to Nigeria 

", ļorr..ro.-general, andbetween ..grz and, rgrg he oversaw rh" 
"*,..rrio. of indirect rule to

the southern and western regions of the colony. The proconsuļ then
turned propagandist, and The Dual Mandate, which ie published inr9zz, made the case that indirect rule was, according to Margery
Perham, 'the most comprehensive, coherent and renowned system ofadministration' in British imperial history.r0

In the inter-waf yeafs Lugard's model, or what was thouģt to be hismodel, came to be regarded as by ,f.ar the most significant movement
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14. The king of ihe Asante and the governor of the Goļd Coast, r93 5.
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now proceeding in our colonial Empire,. It was adopted widely
throughout coroniar Africa: the cultivation of traditionar societies
'whose hierarchies courd be harnessed to serve British ends,. In the
early rgzos a concerted effort was made in the Northern Sudan to
establish rule through tribar chiefs, Arab sheikhs whom it was thought
resembled those in Nomhern Nigeria. And at_the end of the decade Sir
John Maffey, who had previously serveä with the Government of
India's Politicaļ Department, introduced it into parts of the Southern
Sudan as well.ll In the former German colony of Tanganyika, which
Britain now held as a League of Natrons Mandate, Lugard,s protėgė,
Sir Donald Cameron, superseded the German system of direct .rle ty
'restoring the old tribar organization' that he supposed had previousry
existed, and that he also hoped would act as a countervailing force to
the white settlers in Kenya-,2 In the Goļd Coast, indirect rĮļle was
codified and exrended during the inter_war years: the king of the
Asante, whose forebear had been exiled by the British in rg96, was
aļļowed home in t 9z4, and in ry3 5 his successor was instaļled as head
of an extensive confederation. And in Northern Rhodesia, which was
taken over from the British South Africa Company in r9z4,rhe same
system was subsequently implemented by Sir James Maxwell.r3

\Ī/hat did the end result look like? The coļonial empire never rivalled.
the dizzy, caparisoned splendours of the Raj, since Malayan sultans,
Nigerian emirs and Alrican kings rarery rured over societies rhat were
as venerable, as settled, as ornamental or as rich as the grandest princely
states seemed to be. But tradrtionar India remained the moder, which
meant thar this new empire of indirect rule depended on the
cooperation and support of kings who were presumed to be at the apex
of 'a clearly defined hierarchicar sociery'.ra As a result, chiefs and emirs
and sultans were treated with great shows of public respect by British
officials, especially on such ceremoniar occasions as insm[ations, coro-
nations, investirures, birthdays and jubilees. In Malaya, after federa_
tion, the ruling sultans heļd a durbar every two years, travelling in style
by yacht or rrain or elephant, b'nging with them large retinues and
participating in grand ceremoniars before large crowds. Across the
Indran Ocean at Budo in Uganda, the British built a public school, just
before the First t 7orļd 'W'ar, for the education of locaļ rulers and
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notables. They sited it on the Coronation Hiļl of the Bugandan kings,
and thereafter coronation services took place in the college chapel,
combining British and African ceremonial elements. At rhe school,s
golden jubilee festiviries, pride of place was given ro the 'four kings at
high table'.15

As in India, indigenous royal splendour was matched by imported
proconsuĮrr pomp. A British 8overnor was the direct representative of
the imperiāĮ sovereign, as well as the chief executive officer of the
colonį As such, he was a Potent and impressive figure, an image
memorably captured and vividly conveyed in John Singer Sargent's
swagger portrait of the Malayan proconsul, Sir Frank Swettenham.
He might not aspire to the courtly grandeur and regal magnificence
associated with the viceroys of India or the governors-general of the

great dominions, but he was entitled to a salute of seventeen guns,
and he lived in appropriate splendour at Government House, where
protocol and precedence, bowing and curtseying, mattered a great
deal, and where he was surrounded by enrourages of ADCs and
retinues of servants.l6 Margery Perham, who was a regular visitor to
British Africa during the inter- and post-war years, and Į punctilious
observer of proconsular etiquette, loved all this 'pomp and imperial
circumstance'. Į7hen stayingin ry48 at the Palace, the official residence
of the governor-general of the Sudan at Khartoum, she felt a sudden
spasm of affection for 'the house, the servants, the troops, the.cer-
emonial, the statues of Gordon and Kitchener'. Even in the r95os
Britrsh proconsuls remained impressive (sometimes, even, flamboyant)
figures. Ąmong them was Sir Edward Twrning in Tanganyika: tall,
fiercely royal and an ardent student (and inventor) of ceremonial, his
biography was appropriately entitled A Gust of PĮurnes.1?

These proconsuls were very grand: at the annual dinners in London
of the Corona Club, founded in rgor for high-ranking officeis of the

coloniaļ service, governors and former governors occupied the top
table'in a|| their įazzĻing splendour','begartered and bemedalled' and
'festooned with colourful decorations'.l8 Bur they were also the apex
of an elaborate local social hierarchy, which (as in India) reached
upwards to the British monarch in London, and downwards to the
smallest provinciaĮ village. It was a complex, manyJayered structure,
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as paramount kings were directly responsible to the governor_general,
and beneath them were often many levels of subo.di.r"t. .hi.fly;;;_ority. This almost Kiplingesque sense of the imperial .hri" .ib.;;;.well caught in a contemporāry account of the Pathfinder s.."Į.""rNorthern Rhodesia, who were all members of the Bantu ,;į;;';;who were described as .loya.l to the King, tothe King,s representadveirr Northern Rhodesia, to his ChieĘ r.,JTlib"tela.į,,"īi.Įä.;;

and those under him-,. It was the ,"m" i., T"nganyika after Cameronhad done his worļ<: 'the peasant', rrirrr.rį-įor"ted, was .now ļinkedup to his Headman, the ĮIeadman . .t. ir -ct i.Ę th. Sub-Chief tothe ChieĄ and the Chief to 
'h. 

Di'"i.;;;..'. 
4rd from there, thechain of connection was clear: tir. airt i.t ļfncer was ļinked to thegovernor, and he was lirrked to the king.re

of course' there were variadons across the coronies in the exact modeand extent of indirect rule, and in ,t. .r",uĮ of the local hlerarchiesthrough which this rul
or at least 

', 
*". J;',Jil.';'J;o.1 :iil5:,"lTįj,ĮllliĮ-ilj'

For' however different their social b;.į;;;., the governors, resi-den and district comr
soci ar vision or their r:T:fff fi ff :i:;T,,*;il :#;T; ii:Treproduced and confirmed in Africa. Til;;;..ed sociery was par_ernalistic' hierarchicaļ and rural, *i,r, i"įi'iär"i layers and gradationsofstarus, such as survivedjn Brirri, *;;.";ilno.o esrares, althougheven there it was being eroded.r. o". of ;; ;;"l.rr.otorri"t governors,Sir Hugh Clifford, never forgot being ;;į;;:;;r,ld in the late r 87os,around thefarms andcottages of hisĮousr",i"* aroard, atUgbrookePark in Devon: ,It 

seemed tį-*.,, h...."ll.älĮĮn.rrn, had suddenlybecome part of a great familyand congregaįr.'.l ,r. thought it was .anearlyperfectsocial organiz"tion', 
"ndĪ, 

lii. ,į"., or.oronial service hehoped to identiff and to nurture similar sociaļ structures abroad. Therewas about aļl this what has been called 
" 

'fu.ra"į..rraļ Burkeian con-servatism'_ a sense of natural rightness ,.rd .ooį.an"ss of traditionaļstructures and slowly evolving institutionr, 
"rrd"., 

,."rr rrĮ..rĮffiof the position of indigenous elites by analogy with their own,.21But it was not just that societies roona orĮrr.". seemed to resemble
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society as it existed in Britain, as (in Clifford,s case in Malaya) .castle

and cottage bėcame court and kampong'.z2 For it seemed to the more
romantic imperialists that society overseas was (like rhē Indian villages
and princely states) actually better - purer, more stable, more paternal,
less corrupted. As the metropolis became ever more urbanized, indus-
triaļiznd and democratized, and as its social fabric correspondingĮy
decayed, qhese faraway societies, with their traditionaļ hierarchies still
intact,-noionly became more appealing, they also needed protecting
from the very same fo ces of modernity that were destroying traditional
Britain. such were the views of charles Temple, a resident in Norrhern
Nigeria before the First world war, and rhe son of Sir Richard Temple,
the governor of Bombay. He'adrrrired aristocracy, despised individuaĻ
ism, and regarded European industrial capitarism as a decadent form
of society'. For him,'the duty of colonial trusreeship lay . . . in protect_
ing the virtues of northern aristocratic life and its communal economy
from įhe "barbat|uing" effects of European capitalism, democracy and
individualism'.23 

(

As in India, so in Africa: these opinions were widely shared among
British politicians and administrators. From this perspective, indirect
rule of dark-skinned races was about admiration rather than condes-
cension: much more 'a recognition of indigenous genius' on the part
of native peoples than it was 'a sentence of perpetual inferiority, for
them, a genuine wish to hold back the corrupting forces of capitarism
and exploitation, so as to let tradition thrive and hierarchy flourish.
This was how thę British saw things in their new, tropical empire, and
it was (as usual) on the basis of how they saw things ar home. Indirect
rule, Margery Perham once revealingly admitted (and she was herself
the product of'an ordering of society based upon rhe exigence of
social class'), 'derives from our conservatism, with its sense of historical
continuity and its aristocratic tradition'.2a Time and again, the British
viewed their dependent empire as like the Raj: the landed, layered
order that they fealedwas being losr at home, but that they wanted to
nurture and protect overseas. on the eve of independence, the indigen-
ous elite of ceylon was described by the young patrick Gordon lTalker
as'extremely rich landowners,with local power and influence compar-
able to a r Thig landlord's in George III,s time'.2i
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Here was a classic (and by now familiar) instance of visualizing the

empire by analogy to the social structure as it had once existed in
Britain. Nor shouĮd this continuing cult of connection and equivalence
come as any surprise. For between t9x9 and r948 the person primarily
resPonsible for recruitment to the Brrtish Coļonial Service was Sir
Ralph Furse, whose visron of British sociery, both domesric and
imperial, lyas unashamedly rural, hierarchical and nostalgic. He was
the scion of ä county family in Devon; country life, country virtues and
country'?eople Ļere his 'ultimate realities'; he possessed .an unswerv-
ingly aristocratic bias in social and political arrangements,; and he saw
colonial administratron abroad as 'a crusading service', ,forming-the

natuta] counterpaĪt to the obligations of rqui.., to tenānts in Eng-
land'.26 In selecting the young men who would go out and administer
tĮre empire, Furse did everything he could to ensure that they shared
his vision. Ruling through 'traditional'aurhoriries was how the English
had always governed themselves; it was how they had come ro govern
'W'ales, Scotland and parts of lreland; and now it was horg they came
to govern their overseas empire. As such, 'Merrie Africa, reflected,
matched - and even in some ways surpassed -.Merrie England,.27

And it lasted until the Second World 'Ųfar, when, like the princely
rulers of the Indian states, the emirs and chiefs and sultans once again
came to Britain's aid, supporting the supreme sovereign in his time of
supreme need. Consider in this regard the career of the man who; in
r948, became King Lewanika III of Barotseland. He was born in rggg,
and before assuming the kingship was chief of the district of Kuta at
Mankoya" During the First'Ųforld '!Var he had Įed the Barotse Ifar
Carriers to the East African campaign, and betweeĪL Ī939 and, :-.945 he
(rn tĮe words of his Wįo's 'Wbo entry)'encouraged the war efforr by
the production of rubber and funds'.28 In the same way, during 1939

' 
and, r94o the rulers of the Federated Malay States provided the British
government with gifts totalling f,r.5 million, and the ruiers of the
Unfederated States {riere scarcely less generous. And in 1943 the col-
onial secretary, Oliver Stanley, visited Nigeria, where the emrr of
Bauchi declared: 'I and my brother Emirs, and all of our people, are
continually praying that God will bļess and prosper the armed forces
of the Aļlied Nations and speed the day of victory.,29
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It was these people _ the .chiefs, landowners, sultans or sheikhs, _ onwhom the British felt they could rely, 
".ra 

*i* whom (as with theircounterparts in India) they were mostcomfortable.3o Indeed, thi, į"ri.yand'these perceptions were stilļ in operadon in some parts of thecolonial empire towards the end. lu.i.rg the late r95os, when con_vinced thar they would remain a militaį and imperial power in theĮndian Ocean, the British sought ,o ,".u..lh. future of their navalbase in Singapore - a large, bustling, cosmopolitan town, with a hugeChinese working class of disturbiŲy (and^increasingly) Communist
sympathies. The traditional and long-pondeied solutiorr ĪMas to mergethe ciry into a larger Federation oi M"ļ"y$r, where the ruraļ andconservative curtures of Malaya (where the surtans remained domi_nant), of Sarawak (where the Brookes had been .white rajas, betweenr84r and r94r) and of Nonh Borneo (where company rule hadbelatedly been replaced by indirect rule) would ourweiģ the urbanradicaļs of Singapore. The federation duly came into being benveent96r and Ī963 _ almost the ļast such imperial impulse, and still usingthe old system nearly one hundred y."r, frorn the signing of thePankgor Treaty that had effectively initiated it.31

(

oir the eve of the First world 'Ų7ar, and notrvithstanding the pani-
cipation of France, Germany and Belgium in the 'scramble forAfrica',
the British Empire was still.very much the greatesr and the grandest in
the wodd. Taken together, the dominions of settlement, the Indian
Empire and the tropical colonies comprised an imperium that.xas
without rival in terms of its territorial extenr, its mixture of variety and
coherence, and its unifying characteristics of hierarchy and tradition.
By comparison, the German and Belgian Empires might also be royal,
but they were rather small; the Portuguese and Spanish Empires were
also royal, but demoralized; and the French Empire might be large, but
it was republican. After the First l7orld War the final extension of the
British Empire took place in the Middle East, with the dissolution of
the ottoman Emģre, and the setting up of new kingdoms in the l.eague

of Nations Mandates inJordan and lraq. Not surprisingly, given what
had happened in sub-Saharan Africa since the r87os, these new-old
kingdomš were explicitly conceived on the model of the Indian princely
states. The First'Ī orld war may (or may not) have made the world_
safe for democracyl for another generation, and in yet another part of
the world, it certainly made the British Empire safe for hierarchy.

This last act of traditional-cum-imperial social engineering also needs

to be set in the br6ader contexts of cultural attitudes and historical
precedents. Before the Įate nineteenth century most well-born, welĻ
read and well-travelled Britons, following the South Asian examples

set by Bentinck and Dalhousie, had despised what they regarded as the

despotic politics and squalid conditions of the orient. Bur, as with the
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British in post-Mutiny India and posr-scramble Africa, their attitudessubsequently underwent a significant change. This was partry becauseof the more romantic image of the Arabs projected by writers suchas Sir Richaro a".:1, which increasingly,Įepict.o 

".* "li"ririgentlemen .translated.into 
another idio-;; r.rd p".tly 

", ".";;;;;:;of their growing feelings of insecurity ," *fr", they regarded as anincreasingly hostile domestic .n"iro.rm..rt. Ī..heg confronted by agri_cultural depression, mass politics in the cities, antįIandlord agitationin Ireland and attacks on the House of Lords itseļį many anxious anddisenchanted patricians came ro admire (and to envy) the magnificentBedouin chiefs and tl
thatestablish.o,*J';;::::il:.*:*iäffi 

"Tiää'jTiprevailed, where the ancient values of chivalį and honour were pre-served, and where there was .a feeling of 
".."p. from the f,ries ofmodern life - disillusion, doubt, a..o.Ļ.y,., 

-

'.. 
rr1r, appreciatively regarded, the Arab emĻs and sheikhs seemedļike the Indian princes and Nigerian .ri.r, Įnry more so: noble andsuperior leaders, the patrons ,rrd p.ot .tĮ of a traditional, orderedworld, which had once existed in Britain; but which was now underserious threat. These oi*:'., which clearĻ had much in commonwith those of Harcourt Butrer in India and charres Tempre in Africa,were shared by \[rilfrid Scawen Blunl A Sorro squire who hated themiddļe classes' mass politics, 'selfish firr"n.i.r.' 

".rd 
,greedy 

Jews,, hetravelled e*ensively in the Middl. p"r, *ā bought an estate nearCairo; he also spoke fuabic, bred Arab horr* ĻĮ ,""* ,ocal costume.2Īhey were shared by Mark Sykes, who wa, į" i.o.o a baronetcy andthe Sledmere Estate in Yorkshire, disliked į" iį"n 
""d 

the IndustrialRevolutions' admired Arab society as layereį, .rį*.o, traditional anddefaential, and regarded the great sheikĻ, 
""ä 

į*arh chiefs as fellowaristocrats with whom h1 misht taļk on equal terms. And they wereheld by the Hon. AubreyHerbert, th. rrod.iālohn Brchan,s SandyArbuthnot, who 'rode through the Yemen, *hi.Ļ ,ro white man everdid before', hated politicians, the lor.g.oĮ;. ,od Lloyd George, andloved 'thrones, chieftains, bandits, a"lng"ror._Į*itories and fierceloyalty'.3

This growing attachment to the fuąb world, by fuĪns patrician,
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romanric and escapist, coincided with the gradual extension of British
power into th'e Middle East - an exrension that took for granted that
these traditional rulers should be sustained and supported..Ųfhen Egypt
was invaded and occupied in r88z, Britain governed indirealy throuįh
the khedive (later sultan, and the direct descendant of the figure in
't filkie's painting), following the precedents and pra*rce of the Indian
princely sg'ątes, and relying on their.resident consul-generaļ to ensure
that older was preserved, that the national finances were restored, and
that thē Suez Canaļ Ļas protected.a on the fuabian peninsular and in
the Persian Gulf, the British made treaties with the sultan of Muscat,
with the sheikhs of the Trucial Coast of Oman, with the ruler of
Bahrain, with the sheikhs of eatar and with the sheikh of Kuwart,
which established them as the 'paramounr power in much of the
fuabian peninsular'. And when Britain went to war with the ottoman
Empire in r9r4, it supported Sherif Hussein (the mosr prominent
member of the Arabian nobility, the paramount chieftain in rhe area
and the founder of the Hashemite dynasty) and his sons in their
revblt "gainst the Turks.s This policy was especially advocated by the
C,airo-based Arab Bureau, with which Herbert and Sykes were both
connected. The latter was especially influential in urging rhe need for
Britain to create post-war Arab kingdoms, 'agrarian in nature and
almost medieval in structure', where 'squires, lords and peasants mrģt
live irį reconstituted a*ity', and all 'dĮing homage in their lives.and
thouģts to the divine eternal order of which their society on eafth was
but the mirror'.6

Vith the defeat of the Ottoman Empire, this romantic, hierarchical
impulse became the basis of Britain,s post-war policy, and two people
pursued it with particular vigour, determination and success. The fust
was T. E. Lawrenge, himself a great admirer of Sherif Hussein and his
sons, and a firm bpliever in the traditional order in Britain no less than
in the Middle East. Įn seeking to establish a new Arab settlement, he
was sure that Britain would have the edge over France because of its
layered social structure culminating in rhe monarchy. ,Ancient and
artificial societies like this ofthe Sherifs and feudal chieftains ofArabia,'
he explained, 'found a sense of honourable security when dealing with
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us in such proof that the highest place in our srate was not a prize for
merit or ambition.'7 In seeing himself as a king-maker, L"*.Ļ.. *".
at one with the second influentiar Briton,'winston churchill, who as
colonial secretary in the Lloyd George coarition was responsibre for
putting these ideas into practice. In the aftermath of war, churchill
had evoļved into a fulĮy fledged social conservative, who was dismayed
by the dem,ise of the .old world,, with its .princes and potentates,, its
se;ur; rįins classes and its splendid social pa8eantry. He much regret-
ted the disappearance of the Habsburgs, the Hohenzollerns anJ the
Romanovs, and the 'collapse of settled values and ancient insįitutions,.
And, as colonial secĪetafy, he was convinced that in the Middle East,
as elsewhere in t'he e'mpire, 'British interests were best served by friend-
ship and co-operarion with the party of monarchy and faditio ,.s

At the Cairo Conference of March r9žt, Lawrence and Churchill
souģt to implement their social-imperial ideas by establishing new
royal regimes in the League of Nations Mandates that the British had
been awarded in the Middļe East. For Churchill, they had two special
attra'ctions: they would mean empire on the cheap at a time when
public spending was under severe strain and scrutiny; and they would
establish 'the very best structuĪe', which would be .analogous 

to
princely states irr India'.9 Įn conformity with Britain's wartime policy
(the so-called 'sherifian soludon'), the intention was thar these new
fuab nations would be ruled by sons of SherifHussein. Įn Transjordan,
Hussein's second son, Abdullah, was installed as emir, supponed by
an indigenous administration under British supervision, r,į"a.a y ļ
resident, and with an fuab Legion officered and supplied by the British.
In neighbouring Iraq (Mesopotami"i, Abd.rll"h,s younger brother,
Faisal, who had been ignominiously ejected by the French from the
throne of Syria, was installed from the ou et as king, once public
supporr had been effectivery mobirized (by the British) in his favour,
and he reigned untįJ his death in r933.1o As inJordan, British influence
oyer the king and his country was exercised by a high commissioner,
who sought to control the rurar tribes by increasing the powers of their
head sheikhs. This mode of indirect rure conrinued essentialry unaltered
well after the mandate expired in :1932.11

Although the result of less premeditated and determined poliry, two
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16. The Emir Abduļlah of Transjordan with, among others,
Lord Allenby and Colonel T. E. l.awrenc e, c. t 9zz.



additional new kings appeared in the British-controļled Middle East.

on the oĮļtbreak of war, Egypt had been formally (and belatedĮy)

annexed by Britain, but in rgzz the counmy was declared independent,
'and the sultan lvas elevated to royal status as King Fu,ad. Like his

fellow monarchs in Jordan and lraq, he was advised by a British hiģ
6ommissioner; and imperiaļ communications, the defence of Egypt,

the protection of foreign interesrs and the osrensibly 'Anglo-Egyptian,
Sudan rJnained'explicitly and exclusively under British control. Under
these terms, Egypt was essentially 'a princely state on the Indian
paftern'.12 Across the Red Sea, on the Arabian peninsula, the British
had initially backed Sherif Hussein, and had hoped that he might
become king of Arabia as his sons eventually became rulers of Jordan
andhaq.l3 But Hussein fell out with his sons and with the British, and
refused to accept the settlements of the Cairo Conference. He was
deprived of British support as a resuh and forced to abdicate in 1924.
Soon after, he was driven o t of Arabia by his long-standing rival, Ibn
Sa'ud, who thereupon estabļished himself as king. In r9z7 lbn Sa,ud
signed a treaty that effectively recognized Britain as rhe paramount
power in the region. Ten years later, and using the Malay treaties as a
model, Britain concluded negotiations with tribal rulers in the hinter-
land of the port of Aden, including Sultan Saleh of Mukalla and
Sultan Ja'far of Seiyun. This completed and consolidated its inrer-war
dominions in the Arab world.l4

So by this time the British Middle East was organized on the basįs
of what Gertrude Bell called 'creating kings,, resulting in regimes
that stressed 'solid magnificence' and 'ordered dignity,. There were
proclamations and coronations for the new kings, and durbars at
which 'big sheikhs and nobles', 'magnates of tļre wilderness, and .great

chiefs of the desert' pledged allegiance and paid homage, and the
countryside, the cabinets and the legislatures of these new royal
dominions were d6mrnated by the sheikhly landowners. And the British
residents and high commissioners behaved with appropriate proconsu-
lar pomp: Lord Lloyd in Egypt, with his cocked hat, orders, ribbons
and Rolls-Royce, and Sir Percy Cox in lraq, with his white uniform
and gold lace, 'his air of fine and simple dignity'.rs The result was a
large new imperial dominion based on a romantic, admiring, escapist
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17. King Fu'ad of Ęypt with the prince of Vales, r9z7.
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view of Arab social structure, which closely resembled Rudolph Valen-
tino's celebration of the Bedouin characteristics of 'nobiliry, dignity,
manliness, gracefulness and virility' in his film The Sbeikb (r9zr). Such
perceptions persisted well on into the inter-war years, exemplified by
the Hon. Vilfred Thesiger, nephew of Lord Chelmsford (viceroy of
lndia, 1916-zr), who was born in Abyssinia and spent the r93os
travelling in the Middle East. Like Blunt, Herbeif and Sykes, he had .a

lifėlong craving for barbaric splendour, for savagery and colour and
the throb of drums', a 'lasting veneration for long-established customs
and ritual', a 'deep_seated resentĪĪrent of western.innovations in other
lands'and a 'distaste for the drab uniformia, of?t . modern world'.16

Throughout the r93os įhese'traditionalist' views of Arab society,
and especially of its leaders, remained the basis for British policy
towards its mandates and territories in the Middle East - a srructure
of government that has been aptly described as having been 'born by
the great war, oĮļt of the Indian Rai'. Like the princes of South Asia,
the Hashemite rulers of Iraq and Jordan built palaces designed by
British architects, employed British nannies, tutors and governesses,

and sent their sons to public schools. In lraq, Faisal ruled with Valen-
tinoļike derneanour: 'his voice seemed to breathe the perfume of
frankincense and to suggest the presence of richly coloured divans,
green turbans and the glimer of gold and jewels'.l7 And after his death,

and the ending of the mandate, the climactic years of the monarchy
were dominated by the regency of Crown Prince Abduļillah, who was

devoted to such courtly pastimes as protocol and pedigree; It was the

same i Jordan, where the Emir Abdullah's regime \Ār'as no less regal,

with his palace in Amman, his birds and his falcons, and with the British
resident, Sir AIec Kilbride, in close and cordial attendance. As James
Morris notes' Īelations between residents and monarchs genuinely

seemed 'a meeting of equals'. The officials admired the Bedouin ethos

and, as in the colonial service, 'most of the Britons were men of the rural
gentry', who thus felt'at ease and at home with Arab gendemen'.l8

During the Second World !Var, kingship and rural hierarchy remained
the essential basis of the British perception of the Middle East, and of
the imperial presence there, as they did in Įndia and Africa. In Saudi
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Arabia, Ibn Sa'ud was consistently loyal, playing up the 'Bedouin Arab
conception of kingship'. When visiting him after the Yalta Conference,
'Winston Churchill felt'deep admiration' for the 'warrior vigour, of
this 'patriarchal king of the fuabian desert'. In Jordan, the Emir
Abdullah (whom Churchill rightly described as 'one of my creations')
matcheģ the Indian princes and Malayan sultans in his lloyal and
unwaįering co_oPeratįon', believing that 'with every addition to the
number of enemies, his devotion to the allied cause increased, and that
His Mafesty's Government could depend upon him ro work for the

common good in alļ circumstances'. In lraq, the army rebelled against
the Regent Abdulillah in t94x, whereupon there was a counrer-coup
by the British in favour of the regent and his chief political ally, Nuri
Pasha, after which they both gave long_standing support. And in Ęypt,
Farouk and his government led by Nahas Pasha collaborated with the
British from February Ī942 until the errd of the war.19 Īndeed,,by 1945
the British sphere in the Middle East was more exrended (and more
royal) than ever before, encompassĘ kingly regimes from Libya to
Persia"to Greece. The 'traditional' monarchies in Ęypt, Jordan and
Iraq, and the sheikhdoms in the Persian Gulf and the hinterland of
Aden, were the key to it. Here was the final extension of the Chur-
chilļian enterprise begun in Cairo in t9zt.zo

Īhereafter, these kingly corļnections and hierarchical perceptions
continued in essence unaltered. As foreign secretary in the post-war
Labour governme t, Ernest Bevin aspired to be the reformist successor
to Dalhousie, Bentinck and Chamberlain. He beļieved British imperiai
policy in the Middle East had hitherro 'resred on roo narro!\, a footing,
mainly on the personalities of kings, princes or pashas', and he wanted
to give Britain's relations with these Arab kingdoms'a new and more
attractive look' by working with 'the peasants'against 'the pashas'-
to develop these countries politically, economically, educationally and
socially.2l But in practice very Įittle changed. In Ęypt, the British
corrtinued to rely on King Farouk, whom they thouģt was popular
and should not be anragonized. 'The monarchy has prestige and it has
continuity,' one Foreign Office mandarin observed. 'Let us give it a
run.' And so they did. It was the same in Transjordan, where the
mandate endedin ry46,and where the British (following the Egyptian
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precedenr of rgzz) showed their gratitude to the Emir Abdutah bycrearing him king. H1 was ,"g^rārd, i.rĻl-ct*"tillian ferms, asbelonging .to 
a generation in wii.h ;;;." hardy souls, capable ofriding all day, fasting if need b", #;;;

opportunity arose,. At tļre end * į,; įil;r,:Į:J::l ;ĮJ::il.:thanked the British 'for having.ri;;; within twenŲ-five years,from an unk own corner of the Otom"o E_pi.. to the status of anindependentkingdo,.22
It was stiļl the sarne too in lraq, where the

orr Nuri Pasha, the Regent e a,iirrą tr,.;:ffffi;:Į:1f ::ll
:::;:r-.1l'1llį1*::::-:l'h4;1,oĻ*"*,,h-h.;,;;
wasgenerally*,J:':i'.'Jį',Į'::': j:';ä;f įĮT,ffi Īfamiļiar analogical trope, that th. ..g..rt 'h", 

" 
g..rt admiration andliking for Britain and for ,i,i'r, *įiiļĮ.'-ro persons. His cars, hisaircraft' his clothes' his hunters, rri, r.*įį."as, even his swans, areBritish, and so are many of his closest frienjs., He was, indeed, thevery model of an English couatry gentleman, o. p.rhrpr, more appro_priately, he resembļed a young George IIĪ.23 And it was the same in thePersian Gulf where' aftcr Ināirn ii.p*a*.., the British residentswho had advised the ruļers corrtinued ,i* *ļru. Alļ that had changedwas that whe""s pr'viously they had b..n ."į.oit d from the ICS andreported to New Delhi, they we." no*p.ouid.Į by the Foreign of6ce,answered to London, and received theį instructions from the foreign

;'.T:7;::11.l*viceroy. 
Even in the early r95os British adviseĮ,

Middle r*,,, *t... (iiįTfTiäįi'##i: ,ffji,ffi;l;
adhered to a 'rigid sryle.of po*p ..ra i*Įį.į, 

"r..u-rtance,, and

;,TJ:.*. 
kings they h"d .r."teJ ,rirr ,.įäįĮ the only dependable

As late as the r95os and early r96os the southern part of Arabianear Aden and rhe coastrine of the persian crti."*"i.r.d areas wheretradinonal nodons of empire and of imperial hĮ.rr.hy survived andwere even extended' In the Eastern and Ī.estern Aden Pfotectofates,indirect rule via the sultans and sheiļ<hs had ,l*ays been the Britishmode' and in 19 59 tļrese varied and assorted ernirates were united in a

go
r8. King Faisal II of lraq, paying a state visit to London, 1956.
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federation' Four years rater they-were merged in their turn with theport and colony of Aden so as to form the FĮeration of South Arabia.The aim was clear, and redolent 
"r,rr. 

r'JįĮ the r9zos and r93os:to use (in Prime Minister Harold Macmillan,s words) .the influenceand power of the sultans, as a 
"ooo,.rpoir. įo th. o.b"., world ofradical'middle-class nationalism - n*, *r. ,rį., in regard to Calcutta(or Singapore) but to the cosmopol,"" ,..Į,., of Aden.ā FurthernortĮr, the GuIf sheikhdr

time-warpversion.,,JĮ:Į:1:::l.1"'.fi 
lJ;.1",:."1,;:'*::ä:

sultan of Muscat and oman had .*or., ..Į..r"J devotion and fideliry,to Lord Curzon on his vj;er;sal visitation 
'r;r"'.Įn 

the r96os thesultan's descendant still lived in ti, p"t"..,_"iā the Union Jack stillflew over the nearby residence of tįre *įi .l.,rul-g..,.."l (as theresident was now more tactfully called). B'; ;y;į." the princely stateof oman was littļe more than 
"..tic oi*.įmiir. ,r,", rr"a been.26

PART THREE

GENERALITIES
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complere with coats of arms and mottoes, were hung in the chapels of
their orders. They were concerned with religion because, with the
excePtion of the Indian ordērs, all the ordersof chivalry were Christian
foundations. And they \Mere concerned with monarchy because, as
anorher authoriry on India observed, 'The crown is the Fountain of
Honour, and those who accept its decorations or privileges owe, and
admit their liability for, something in returri.,3o

As this remark implies, the acceptance of an honour did not merely
elevate someone in the social and imperial hierarchy; it also put them
formally in a direct, and subordinate, relātion to the monarch. For as
the'Fountain of Honour', British kings and queens were, among other
things, sovereigns of all the orders of chivalry. As their day-to-day
political involvement ļessened in Britain, they became ever more inter-
ested in the creation, regulation, e*ension and distribution of these
imperial honours. Victoria, Edward VII and George V were closely
involved in designing and naming the new orders that were inaugurated
during therr reigns; George VI was most at ease at investitures, and
revived the installation ceremoniaĮs associated with the Order of the
Garter and rhe Royal Victorian Order; and all of them were preoccu-
pied with unrforms, heraldry, precedence and genealogy, and with
decisions concerning the award of British honours to foreign poten-
tates.3l Dunng the inter-war years, successive sovereigns gave particu-
lar attention to decidrng the ļocation of the new chapel for the order
of the British Empire. It was eventually dedicared rn St paul,s Cathedral,
the 'parish church of the Empire', in 196o. It was just in time - or
perhaps it was lust too late?32

8
Monarchs

'Is the Queen of England,' inquired Lord Elgin while governor-general

of Canada (r8ąz_sąl"to be the sovereign of an Empire, growing,

expanding, strengthening itself from age to age?'The answer soon

became - and remained - unhesitatingly in the affirmative. From the

mid nineteenth century, the political power of the British sovereign

waned, while the territories of the British empire waxed. Here was a

coirrcidence that was aĮso an opportunity - to create a new function,

purpose and iustification for monarchy, at a time when it was in need

of all these things, by connecting it with, and lending its historic lustre

to, the recently and rapidly expanding empire. And so, thanks largely

to Disraeli, the Brįtish monarchy was refurbished and reinvented as an

imperial crown of unprecedented reach, importance and grandeur.l

One indication of this tį)tiās that from r 876, successive sovereigns were

emPresses or emperors of India as welļ as queens or kings of the United

Kingdom of Great Britain and (Northern) Ireland. Another was that

from King Edward VII onwards, all of them were additionally styled

as ruler of the'British Dominions beyond the Seas'. More substantively,

this meant that from Victoria to George VI, British sovereigns unified

an imperįal dominion of ever greater dimensions, and ordered an

imperial hierarchy of ever greater complexity.2

But this was not iust a matter of tituļar elevation and stylistic

innovation. For as British monarchs were themselves becoming much

more imperial, so the British Empire was itself becoming much more

royal. This two-vįIay process, whereby an imperialized monarchy
merged with and moulded a monarchicalized empire, was exceptioĪr-

ally complicated, and we still know (and care) strangely Įinle about it.3
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Indeed, from the generally egalitarian_cum_republican perspective ofthe early twenty-first century, it is easy to forget the extent ,o *tri.hlin its heyday, the British Empire was iroyot ,^poe, presided ou.. 
"nJunified by a sovereign of global amplitude and semįdivine fuļļrr..., 
"nįsuffused with the symbors and signifiers of kingship, which reinforced,legitimated, unified and completed the empire as a reaļm boundtogether by order, hierarchy, tradition and"subordination. But it isalready possible to sketch the outlines of thį end result _ the creationand projection of a transcendent vision of this right-royar realm, mirn- .

icking and mirroring.in its earthly .o"i"l oį. the divine ranks andcelestiaļ hierarchies of the heavens.o

One indication of this was-that many places in the British Empire werenamed for and after British ki.rg, 
"oJqo.ens. This was a sign both ofpossession and of commemorafion, of acquisition and veneration, andno royal name \Ą/as more widely or frequently bestowed i, ,rri.,*"y

than that of Victoria' Her reign .oincideā with one of the greatest erasofgeographical exploration and imperial expansion; and the ubiquityof her appelladon across the grobe and around the worrd mereryaccentuated the semįdivine status she acquired by the r88os anär89os, since to have so many parts of the world labelļed for thequeen-empress was itseļf a sott of geographical deification and 
"arthĻapotheosis. For her name was literally euerytuhere: there was theVictoria Nile in Uganda, the Victoria Coloį irr Australia and theVictoria Faļls on theZambezi;there were.i* Ļt. Victorias and twoCape Victorias; and around the world there were Victoria Range, Bay,Strait, Valley, point, park, Mine, peak, Beach, Bridge, County, Cove,Downs, Land, Estate, Fjord, Gap, Harbour, Headtand and Hiil. Bysuch means the queen-empress seemed to be omnipresent in her ownempire; and, as James Morris has noted, this set .such 

seal upon theworld, in caĪtograPhy as in command, as no monarch in the history ofmankinrd had ever ser before'.s
But in addition to being a period of unprecedented exploration andexpansion, the victorian era witnessed unprecedented urban growth.Many new towns weĪe named, and old town' ..;;;;;;;

Gas-Lit Gloriana: in 'Ųfest Africa, Labuan, Guiana, Grenada, Hon-
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duras, Newfoundland, Nigeria, and on Vancouver hrand. And in these
cities (and many others) the pervasive sense of royarty was further
enhanced with the provision of permanent images and icons of mon-
archy. Starues of Victoria (especially), and also of Edward VII, George
V and George VI, were prominently placed in city squares and in
front of government hous.r. From cairo to canberra, wellington to
Johannesburg, Var/couver tb Valetta, the image of the queen-empress
appeared, often in canopied magnificence. She was 

"o**.-o."a.ļalmost everywhere in her lifetime. It was more usual for the king_
emperors to be sculpted on horseback, and only after their deaths.
There were also more specific constructions, many of them very
er*ravagant, including the Victoria Terminus in Bombay (appropri_
ately opened in 1887), Curzon,s Vicroria Memorial in Calcutta (which
wās not comPleted until twenty yeafs after the queen's death), and the
Royal York Hotel in Toronto (for long known as .the largest hotel in
the Empire').6 More mundane, and yet more ubiquitous, were the
roads, streets, düves, lanes, terraces, squares, crescents, ways and
avenįres named King or Emperor, or Queen or Empress, or Victoria or
Edward, or George or Elizabeth, or Coronation orJubilee, whichcould
be found in villages, towns, suburbs and cities in every colony and
every dominion.

This powerful and widespread sense of the royal presence through_
out the empire was not just cartographical, sculptural, architecnrral or
cadastral. For the imperial monarchy intruded itself into the individ,al
lives and collective consciousnesses of imperial subjects in numercius
ways and at many levels. The sovereign was head of the armed forces
of the empire, from whom all officers held their commissions directly.
The supreme rewatd for military vaļour was the Victoria Cross, while
that for civilian coĮrrage was the George Cross. Throuģout the empire,
coins and stamps bore the image of the queen-empress or the king_
emperor. All letter-boxes were dignified by the royal cypher; the post
that was collected from them was called the royal mail; and offrciar
correspondence was sent in envelopes marked On Her or On Hk
Majesty's Seruice. In Chrisrian churches throughout the empire, the
monarch was prayed for each Sunday. The national anthem of the
empire was neither about nation nor empire, but was the martiaĮ,

ro3
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chivalric and hierarchical exhortation that .God 
Save the King,.7 Coļ-

onial law courts, dominion parliaments, regimental headquarters and
government houses were decorated wrth royal portrairs *d *;;;;
arms. The loyal toast *i. _9T at the end of all formal 

""d *;;
informal dirrners. end schd6ļchildren were taught the history of their
empire as the history of Britain,s kings and queens _ though Lord
Lugard discouraged schools in Nigeria from teaching abour.nJS,r"*E
since this might'foster disrespect for authoriry,.s

These were the day-to-day convergences b.Ļ..., empire, monarchy
and hierarchy: an amalgam of names, places, buildings, i*"g.r, ,trtr.ļ
rituals and observances that made it impossible fo. ,rryorr. to forg.t
or ignore the fact that they were subjects of a sovereign rather than
citizens of a republic. This, in turn, explains *hy gāu...rors wefe
garlanded with ribbons and stars, why governors-general were bowed
and curtseyed ro, and why the viceroy of India was preceded by the
playing of the national anthem when he enrered the state dining room
in New Delhi - not so much because these proconsuls were.great men
in their own right (although some undoubtedly were), brt b"Įor. th.į
were the representative of the monarch, and as such enjoyed regal
conseque ce, speaking for the sovereign aļmost as a priest might speak
for God.9 That was, in a sense, their rgrost impoĪtant public function:
to show imperial subjects overseas that while imperial monarchs might
live in London, they reigned over everyone in the empire, *h...Ļ
they miģt be, and weĪe to receive appropriateexpressions of homage
and fealry in return. As Lord Elgin explained when viceroy .f f";;;,
the r89os, čhe prime purpose of going on large tours was ,to af'ford
opportunities to Her Majesty,s subjects in the presence of Her Maj-
esty's rėpresentatiįe in India for maniiestations o}loyalry and affectio,n
for her throne and person,.ro

The British Empire as a royal empire was nor only about maps and
statues and coins and stamps and bending the knee to the sovereign,s
representadve: it was also, as Lord Elgin,s comments imply, about the
creation and performance of public ceremonials that were, Iike the
honours system, gĮobally inclusive, elaborately graded and intrinsically
royal.. At the most routine level, grand receģions were held in

Īo5
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8overĪrment houses throughout the emPife on the official and unofficial
bimhdays of the monarch, and invitatio s to these occasions were
eagerly sought- Ar a higher level of ceremonial intensity, the anniver-
sary of Queen victoria's birthday was (from r9o4) observed as Empire
Day in schools in villages, towns, cities and caprtals around rhe globe.
There were processions and parades, hymns were sung, and speeches
were made by scoutmasters and schoolmasters, mayoĪs and lord
mayofs, governors and viceroys, in which thė)ordered unity of the
empire was extolled, and the sovereign was presented as ,all-knowing
and all-caring'.11 In addidon to this shared annual festival, dominions
and colonies evolved their own special fėtes of royalty,marking par-
ticular episodes and connections, such as King,s Day in the Suāan,
which throuģout the inter-war years was observed as a way of .o.-
memorating the stop-off by George V and eueen Mary on their journey
back from their durbar in India in January r9rz.12

From this settled and secure base ofregular and roudne royal observ-
ances, a whole range of public ceremonials was evolved and elaborated,
invented and inaugurated, to commemorate the rites of passage of
imperial British monarchs in ways that were both far_react irrg 

"ia 
of

unprecedented extravagance. Of course, there had been local .ecog-
nition of coronations, weddings, iubilees and funerals for as long as
there had been a monarchy, and at the time of the Napoleonic.i7ars
these fesdvities had been successfu'y extended to the colonies. But in
the late ninereenth century they were propelled on to a much higher
plane of efficiency, self-consciousness and ostentation, and as the
empire expanded, they were taken and carried along with it. The result
was that from victoria's Gorden Jubilee to George vl,s coronarion,
these ceremonials were observed, not just in Glasgow and Birmingham,
Cambridge and Bath, Ieeds and Manchester, Norwich and york, but
also in Hong Kong and Rangoon, Sydney and Lagos, Nairobi and
Gibraltar, Montreal and Auckland, and in cou dess smaller towns and
villages. These were shared imperial occasions, with a common style,
involving banners and flags, speeches and s eer parties, military pro_
cessions and relŲous services, the unveiling of statues o. th. op..ring
of memorial halls. And they all stressed history and hierarchy, u.,iį
and order, crown and empire.l3

ro6

23. Queen Victoria's Diamond Jubilee - Thanksgiving Service at St paulJs

Cathedral, 1897.
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These locaļ festivities also provided the building bl<lcks from which
natio al and imperial spectaculars were developed and evolved. once
again, there were precedents in the late eighteenrh and early nineteenth
centuries, associated with the Goļden Ju6ile" of George III and the
pageants marking the end of the Napoleonic Wars, when local observ_
ances fed into London-based celebrations that complemented, com-
pleted and raised these provįncial pa8eants to a higher leveļ ofnational
significance and theatrical splendour.la There was also the more
immediate stimulus emanating from India, where the durbars of rg77,
x9o3 and rgrr served to nationalize a local ceremonial idiom by
bringing together princely India and British India in weekJong festivals
of chivalric unity, feudal hierarchy and imperial subordination.rs But
it was not only east of Suez that what Lord Lynon called .a bit of
bunting'was being made to go a longer way than ever before. For in
response to these Indian etrravei anzįs, a similar culture of ceremonial
ostentation was developed in the imperial capital. From Victoria's
Golden and Diamond Jubilees, to the Silver Jubilee of George V and
the coronation of George Vl,every greatroyal event was also projected
as an imperial event: marked in London by carefully orchestrated
processions, with everyone in their properly assigned place. Thus was
the British Empire presented as an ordered, unified hierarchy, with a
semįdivine sovereign at its apex.16

In London, as elsewhere, the greatest of these occaslons was Vic-
toria's Diamond Jubilee in t897, when the queĖn_"mpress processed
throuģ+he crowded and decorated streets of London, escorted by
fifty thousand troops drawn from all the colonies of the empire, to
receive the homage and acclaim ofher subjects, to attend a thanksgiving
service held on the steps of St Paul's Cathedral, and to enjoy a supreme
moment of earthly apotheosis. The poet laureare, Alfred Austin, wrote
commemorative verse. A provincial composer named Edward Elgar
produced an 'Imperial March', 'something broad, noble, chivalrous,,
which he later developed into the 'Pomp and Circumstance, Marches.lT
The prime mmister of Canada, lfilfrid Laurier, was knighted on

Jubilee morning. There was an Imperial Fėte in Regent's Park, and an
Imperial Ballet at Her Maļesty's Theatre. Here was the-empire -

huge work of architecture . . . castellated against all comers,

Ī09
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24. Queen Vicroria,s Diamond Jubilee _ decoration s inZanzibar.
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ruĪreted for effect, audaciously burtressed, and ciowned at the top, as

other edifices might be completed with saint or angel, by the portly

figure of Victoria the Queen Empress, holding an orb and.sceptre, and

already bathed in the refulgent light of legend'- putting itself on parade

ās nevef before. It was, wrote G. ]7. Stephens of the DaiĮy MaiĮ,'a
pagearft which for splendour of appearance and especially for splen-

dour of suggestion has never been paralleled in the history of the

world'.į8
Įn this era of heightened ostentation, Delhi and London became the

rwin exemplary centres of these new-old, royal-cum-imperial extrava-

ganzas, which pulsed outwards towards the localities of the imperial

periphery, where they further strengthened and reinforced the com-

munity-based festivities from which they simultaneously drew their

own inspiration and legitimacy. By these interconnected pageants and

mutually reinforcing ceremonials, the British Empire put itself on

display, and represented itself to itselĻ more frequently, more splen-

didly, more ostentatioĮļsly and more globally than any other realm.

The unrivalled extent of its dominions meant this was already true

before r9r4; and after the fall of the great monarchies in the First

World'W'ar, the British Empire was a uniquely royal and rituaļized

realm. And this was no mere ephemeral ceremoniai confection: the

spectacular projection of the queen-empress and king-emperor was

the essence and the heart of the matter.l9 For here was a transcendeĪit

visiorr of the earthly realm as a global hierarchy wįth the sovereign

at its head, which mimicked the celestial realm, which was another

hierarchy with another sovereign at its head. Ės the Daily MaiĮ putit'
on Jubilee Day t897, it was fitting thät the queen should have gone to
pay homage to her God at St Paul's, for in all the world, He was the

only'One Being'who was 'More Majestic Than She'.20

These pageants also served another, and interrelated, roya| PĮįrpose:
for the British monarch was King of Kings in the empire, just as he was

Lord of Lords irr Britain. There miģt be only one sovereign above him;

but there were plenty of them beĮow, those agencies and beneficiaries of
indirect rule who, once placed and ranked according to their standing

and degree, acknowledged the supreme authority of the queen-empress

25. Nrgerian clorh commemorating the SilverJubrlee
of King Ge orgey, r93 5.
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or king-emperor.2l Accordingly, these great London ceremonials,
centring on coronātions, jubilees and funerals, wefe not just mass,
spectacular parades of hierarchy extending outwards towards the peri-
phery from the metropolis; they were iāļso occasions when distant
monarchs came to the imperial capital to pay tribute and pledge fealty.
Adorned in costumes that yielded nothing in magnificence to western
ceremoniaļ dress, or cļad in the sashes iand stars, the collars and
mantles, of the Indian orders, or the order of st Michael and st George,
or the Order of the British Empire, they made journeys to London that
were widely reported in the local press and acclaimed by their subjects.
For there was nothing more grand than going half a world away to do
homage - a 8esfure of well-connected obeisance that merely increašed
prestige at home.

Nothing like this had happened much before Victoria's jubilees.
But thereafter it became a weļl-rehearsed and well-repeated Paftern,
modelled on the homage done to the viceroy by Indian princes at the
three great durbars, and providing them with the opportunity to pay
tribute in London as well as in Delhi. These ceremoniar visits were
serious and eĮaborate enterPrises: no elephants, but much trumpeting.
The highly decorated maharajaof Jaipur travelled to London for King
Edward VII's coronation 'with one hundred and twenty-five of his
officers and aftendants, a whole ship being chartered for the voyage,.
Appropriately enough, the architect of these arrangements was Swin-
ton Jacob, the maharaja's resident expert in the Indo-Saracenic sryle,
who received the KCIE for his pains on this occasion, and who would
later add to this a CVO in rgrr for his work on the Delhi Durbar.22
The equally decorated sultan of Zanzrbar, whom we have also already
met, did even be er, being present in London for the coronarions of
King George V, King George VI and Queen Elizabeth II, and as a result
he received three coronation Medals to add to the three grand crosses
he already held in three British orders of knighthood.

There were many other potentates who appeared in London to pay
homage to their supreme sovereign. From Malayacame Sultan ldris of
Perak to the coronation of Edward VII, and his party included nvo
leading local chiefs, his son, his son-in-law and his .bodyguard of
Indian troopers'. when he was toļd of the king,s illness and of tļre

MONARCHS

postponement of the 'tremendous ceremony' that he had ttavelled

across the world to see, the sultan went into re eat, spending two days

in prayer for his sovereign's recovery.23 From Barotseland came King

Lewanika for the same coronetion. He was enthusiastically welcomed

by metropolitan society, he had royal carriages put at his disposal, the

horses were taken out in a Dorset village where the locals pulled the

king in triumph, and the visit was in ąll ways the climax of his career.

'When kings are seated together,' he observed, 'there is never a lack of

things to discuss.'Lewanika's successor, Yėta III, achieved equal ģory
at the coronation of x937,when he was received by King George VI,

arrd an account of his visit was published by his secįetary. This king

had no doubt of the cosmic transcendence of the ceremonials he had

witnessed: 'Nobody,'his secretary wrote, 'could think that he is really

on earth when seeing the coronation procession, but that he is either

dreaming or he is in paradrse.'2a

In between these ceremonial encounters, the ruling princes and

subordinate royalties of India, Africa, Malaya and the Middle East

made regular private visits to 'Windsor, Balmoral and Buckinģam

Palace, where they were greeted, honoured and entertained- As at

coronations, they were viewed, from one perspective, as traditional

feudatories in the imperial hierarchy visiting their supreme sovereign:

so when in r9:.9 the paramount chief of Basutgland visited Britain for

an audience with George V, he was refused permission to proceed to

Rome, for fear that he 'miģt be unduly rmpressed by the pomp and

state of rėception at the Vatican' and might form the conclusion that

the Pope was morė important than the King'.ā But the;{.. were aĮso

regarded as fellow sovereignŠ, as members of the imperial trades union

of royalty that, after r9r8, came to matter much more to'the British

crown than the (in every sense) much reduced European monarchies.

Hence, in 1944 King George VI sent the already-much-decorated

sultan of Zar:ribar a message of congratulation on the bicentenary of

his dynasty, paying tribute to'the friendship and loyalty so generously

extended to my Father and to myself throughou the thirry-three years

of Your Hiģness's reign; and especially through t'wo long and bitter

',r4ars'. Here, in more senses then one' was the British Empire as a royal

empire - a point made, more brutally, by Sir I illiam Slim to King

ĪĪ3
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Farouk of Egypt, when, as chief of imperial general stafį he reminded
him that there were 'no kings on th. oįh.. siįe of the Iron Cuftain,.26

In this empire of kings, there was also reĮiprocation from the metrop-
olis, as British royalty, and eventually the British monarch. th"*..lĮ,
journeyed out to the empire. During the second and third Oor.... of
the nineteenth century, the most 

".d.nt 
lĮy" rts in Canada and Aus-

tralia had'urged that eueen Victoria se d out her younger children to
found cadet branches of the British monarchy in the coronies. These
schemes (which weĪe supported by Anthony Trollope) came to noth-
ing'27 But they echoed down the decades .rrrįiļ ,h" Second Ī.orld.\,ar,
as alternative arrangements were evolved for associating th. morr"r.hy
with the empire in a more personal way. One solutionwas ,o .*Oo*
close relatives of the sovereign as governors-general of the great
dominions, thereby rying thern in ever closer association ro ,h" 

".ä*.r,and placing the most ilļusrrious possible representadve of the king_
emperor at the apex ofthe politicar and sociar hierarchy. The first such
appointment, appropriately by Disraeli, was of the marquess of Lorne
(husband of Princess Louise, and thus son_inJaw of qu..r, V;;;
as governor-generaļ of Canada from 1878 to 1883. Here was a .new
experiment in statecraft by which the Crown was employed as an
instrument to proclaim the greatness and unity of the empire,. The
coloniaļs could scarcely contain tJreir delight.2s

Thereafter, this experiment was several times repeated, which meant
the imperial monarchy was made a real presence and vital element in
the empire. The duke of Connaught, Victoria,s favourite son, was
govefįor-general of Canada from 19rr to .,9.,6- the first pioconsul
of royal blood, who gave dominion life ,a focus of great dignity and
prestige'.2e In the inter-war years, royal attention-rurned to south
Africa, where from Ī9Lo to l.9z4 the governor-generaļ was Prince
Arthur of Connaught, whose father had been governor_general of
Canada; and he was followed by the earl of Athlone, who was married
to Princess Alice, a granddaughter of eueen yictoria.There was also
a scheme, widely canvassed at this time, to appoint George V,s four
sons simultaneoušly governors-general of aĻl fourdominions. It came
to nothing, but the notion that the Brrtish Empire was a royaĮempire,

ĪĪ4
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which should be governed and unified by royal proconsuls, reached its
apogee during thę Second World Į7ar: the earl of Athlone, who had
already been governor-general of South Africa, was dispatched to
Canada; the king's elder brother, the duke of Ifindsor, was sent to
goveflr the Bahamas; and the king's younger brorher, the duke of
Gloucester, was installed in 1945 as governor-generaļ of Australia.3o

There was one yet more immediate way in which rhe crown was
made truly imperial, and the empire authentically royal. That was by
majestic journeys to the empire, which reciprocated and paralleled the
pilgrimages made by porentares from the periphery to the imperial
metropolis. These were grand progresses by land and sea, lasting for
many months and covering many miles, involving countless receptions,
dinners, parades and speeches, and all carried on before vast, deliģted
and admiring crowds. The prince of I ales made the first such visit to
Canada in 186o, when he roured Quebec and Ontario, and crossed
over into the United States. He was followed seven years later by his
younger brother, the duke of Edinburgh, who made the first royal

iouhey to the Australian colonies. But the tone and tenor of such tours
was really established when, at Disraeļi's urging, the prince of lfales
went to India in x876.Heheld receptions and durbars in Bombay and
Calcutta; he met many Įndian princes and expressed his strong support
for them; he held a chapter of the Order of the Star of India; and he shot
tigers for recreation.3r Thereafter, hrs brother, the duke of Connaįļght
(whom we have already met as governor-general of Canada), visited
India as the king's representative at the durbar oL ryo3 (when he was
rather upstaged by burzon); and he retur nedin rgzrfor.the opening of
the newlegislatures in Madras, Bombay, Calcutra and New Delhi under
the Montagu-Chelmsford reforms of x9r9.32

Ī'hese royal progĪesses within the empire moved into even higher
gear during the next two generations, as kings and queens set our to

PĪeseĪļt themselves in person to thęir far-off subjects. This meant that
the arrangements became ever more elaborate, and the tours ever more
novel, thrilling and spectacular, as the royal lineaments and sovereign
symbols of empire were brought vividly and vitally aļive. The future
George V visited the Antipodes in rgor to iriaugurate the parliament
of recently federated Australia; and he first went to India in r9o5. He
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returned there amidst unprecedented pomp in Į9 Ī Ī as the first reigning
monarch to set foot in his overseas empire, and crowned frimsef as
emperor'33 Thereafter, he stayed determinedry at home, but his eldest
son, the future Edward VIII, travelļed to ąlmost every part of the
empire between r 9 r 9 and,r9 z5 ; not just to each of the great dominions,
but also to India (where there was a durbar held at the Red Fort in
Delhi for the ruling princes), to much of British ģrica and to the !7est
Indies. And his younger brother was almost as well 

"*.il.į;;;r..,East Africa (tgz+_sl and Australia (lgril as duke of York, anā
Canada (ry1il and South Aftica (t94flas King George VI, when he
became the fust reigning sovcreign to visit either dominion.3a

such majestic appeara ces nrade the faces on the starnps and coins,
the celebration of Empire Day, the possession (or pursuit) of imperial
honours a d the invitations to Government House more rear and
meaningf,l than ever before. As such, they were the direct descendants
of the great domestic progresses of eueen Elizabeth I, ,metaphysical
road shows'in which the sovereign, or a near relative,symbolically
marked out, took possession and beat the bounds ofthis greater royal
realm.3J of course, these progresses meant sliģtly different things in
different parts of the empire. In the old dominions, ą royalvisit was a
visible reaffirmation of the continuing Britishness of the sovereign,s
overseas subjects, and oftheir prace in that metropolitan sociar order.
In South Asia, the monarch appeared as the successor to the Mughal
empeĪor, gloriously ensconcgd at the apex of an ināi8enous hieraĀy.
And he /ent to the colonies, among the tribes and chiefs of Africa, to
show that 'the King continues to watch over you with fatherly care,.
But for all these local differences and particular meanings, the.e
remained one overridi g impression across the length and breadth of
empire. As Jarnes Morris notes, 'to have met, or even to have seen, a
King, a Queen or a Prince of \Vales remained, for miĮlions of the old
imperial subjects, one of the great experiences of life,. .you 

are the big
potafo,'Field Marshal Smuts once informed eueen Mary; .the other
queens are all small potatoes.'36

It is in this royal-imperiar context that we may best understand these
words of George VI after his coronation: .I felt this morning that

rr8

28. Vast crowds in Martin Place, Sydney, during the vrsit of

Queen Ehzabeth II and Prince Philip, 1954.
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the whole Empire was in very tfuth gatĮrered within the walls of
'Ų(i'estminsteĪ Abbey.' Vrrtually it was, and visually tt was, with its
whole diverse sociaļ hierarchy unified, r-anked, ordered, layered and
arranged.3T And this symbiosis between crown and empire seemed set
fair to continue into the next generation. 'Ų7'hen accompanying King
George VI and Queen Ėlizabethon their iour of South Africa, Princess
Elizabeth took the ,occasion of her twenty-fust birthday to pledge
herself to the service of the great imperial family to which she belongeā.
Her own coronation īn 1953 was another imperial spectacle, at which
another monarch reigning under British protection, the much decor-
ated Queen Salote of Tonga, almost stole the show by refusing to make
any concessions to the incļement weather. And the queen's subsequent
tour 'of a still-surviving Empire and of Dominions that fervently
believed in their Britishness' was a sensātionaļ success, especially in
Australia, where it was brilliantly organized,.by Robert Menzies, the
obsequiously loyal federal prime minister. ,perhaps,, he was later to
speculate' in inadvertent corroboration of Edward Hamiļton,s words
of half a century before, 'we are snobs, and love a hierarchical
society?'38

9
Perspectives

What, then, in its heyday from the late 185os to the early r95os, did
the British think the empire they had conquered and settled, governed

and adrrinistered, gone along wit'h and collaboratedin, actuaĮĮy Įooked
lile? To be sure, it was a global phenomenon of unrivalled spaciousness

and ampĮitude, which in its reach and range was both local änd

international, particular and general, and as such it undoubtedly
formed one 'entire interactive system'. It was also as much a part of
the 'tangible world' as it was of the intangible imagination, and in both

these tangible and imaginative guises, it represented - as Peteg Marshall
has very properly observed - ddeliberate, sustained and seĮfconscious

attempt by the British to order, fashion and comprehend their imperial

society overseas on the basis of what they believed to be the ordering
of their metropolitan society at home.l And it cannot be sufficiendy
emphasized that that society, from which these powerful imperial
impulses and imaginings originated and emanated, was deeply con-

servative in its social attitudes and in its political culture. The sociaļ
structuĪe was generally believed to be layered, individualistic, tra-

ditional, hierarchical and providentially sanctioned; and for all the

advances towards a broader, more democratic electoral franchise, it

was in practice a nation emphatically not dedicated to the proposition
that all men (let alone women) were created equal.z

Thus, the imperial metropolis: and thus, unsurprisinģy, the imperial
periphery. To be sure, it was made up of varied dominions and diverse

realms. But there was a homogenizing conve gence about their social
structĮļfes' and about perceptions of them, which was seen by turns

as rural-aspirational (the dominions of settlement), caste-based and
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princely (the Īndian Empire), chiefly and traditional (the crown coloniesof rule), and Bedouin and tribal (the rrrriaįte East). It was further tiedtogether by a shared sense of Britishness, in which tļis sense of anordered imperial society was graded, reinfirced, generalized and pro_clairned by an elaborate system ofhonours and titles, and by a pervasivecult of imperi al royaky, which surged Or"i.o* the metropoiis to theperĻhery, and back again. And aļithis *". b.ought alive, made real_and carried along from past to present to frt r. by ,rrirlled a.rlinterlocking displays of regular .i*"l ,.,ā occasional spectacle.3 Inthese ways, and by th.r. .n."nr, ,r* r;;;;
vernacular socioloįical,i.i";;;.-;;;ffi:,,J::,ii ffi;:and they imported and, analogiz-ed ;;-;;". the empire back toBritain, thereby constructing comfortin, 

"oJ 
fr*,r"r resemblance andequivalencies and affinities.

The result was, i deed, .one vast interconnected world,; and thephrase that best describes ,rri. ....-įlir. i.*.o.""ni. construct ofsubsta ce and sentiment is imperiaĮism as oāmenuĮism. Drawing onprecedents esablished duing ,t" p..ioJof"the R.uolutionary andNapoleonic'W'ars, the British creatį ,n.i. irnp..i"I society, bound ittogether, comprehended it and i*"gin.Ji ?om the middļe of thenineteenth century to the middre or"th. ,*.ntieth in an essentiallyomamentar mode' For ornamentarism was hierarchy made visibre,immanent arrd actual' Arrd since the Britishäceived and understoodtheir metropolis hierarchi cally, it *", ,."a."t
conceived and understood their p*irrr.,y ir rri.t:li:**r,,li::lll
ffĮlkl:Įffi, monarchy and majesry, were the.means by

and sacralizeo A" ;i:;,3.",.li, ;r :::iĮ::iTi.*r#*
organization and perceptio1rn both *".ĮĮįrls and tĮ.re perĻhery:it provided the prevailing ideology or 

"*pirį, 
-"rrd 

it underpinned theprevailing spectacle of,;;lil"#;ä; ;,ffä ffi iäį,,i..,:ffi*#l;Burkeian enrerprise of .faith ... family ...;;*" ... monarchy,,organically evolving in its structu.. 
"į.o." iį-'..rrru.i.r, across thecontinents and across th

showing i, 
""d f";.;;;;:į:* 

with ample available plumage for
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It bears repeating that one aspect of this hierarchical-cum-imperial
rnindset was indeed the cultivation and intensification of racial differ-
ences based on post-Enlightenment attitudes of white and wesrern
superioriry and of coloured and colonial inferioriry (along with the
cultivation and intensification of gender differences based on attitudes
of white and male superiority and white and female inferiority).'when,
as they somerimes did, Britons thought of the inhabitants of their
empire (as they sometimes thought about the inhabitants of rheir
metropolis) in coĮĮectiue rather tharr in individualistic categories, they
were incļined to see them, literally, in terms of crude stereotypes of
bļack and white, and noļess crude relationships of superiority and
inferioriry. So, when theHouse of commons debated Britain's adminis-
tration of Egypt in June Ī9Īo, even the hiģ-minded Edward 'Ų7ood,

who later won fame as the first viceroy of India who would parley on
equal terms with Mahatma Gandhi, spoke conventionally of 'thervhite
man' ruling 'inferior races' of .black people,. And when the Tory
leader, futhur Balfour, observed with characteristic scepticism that'it
is not a question of superiority or inferiority,, the rest of the House did
not seem to share his views.6

But in the broader perspectiueĮf imperial relationships, Balfour was
not entiĪely wrong. For when, as they usually did, the British thouģt
of the inhabitants of their empire (as they usually thought about the
inhabitants of their metropolis) in indiuiduaĮ terms rather tharr in
coļlective categories, they were more likely to be concerned with rank
than with race, and with the appreciation of status similarities based
on perceptions of affiniry. From one perspective, the British may indeed
have seen the peoples of their empire as alien, as other, as beneath
them - to be lorded over and condescended to.7 But from another, they
aļso saw them as similar, as analogous, as equal and sometimes even
as better thantheywere themselves.'He was,' the Viceroy Lord \triiling-
don observed on the death of the Įndian prince (and cricketer) Ranjit-
sinhji, the maharaja jam saheb of Nawangar, .an ambassador of
co-operation, friendship and goodwill between the two races . .. a
great ru|er and a great gentlemān.'8 And this-view was not just socially
conservative, but politically co servative too. For as Lord Lugard once
explained, anticipating Sir'!7'illiam Šlim's later remark about the lack
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of kings on the other side of the lron Curtain, the whole purpose of
the British Empire was 'to maintain traditionar rurerships as a fortress
of societal security in a changing worĮd'. And in that enterprise, the
colour of a person's skin was less significant than their position in the
locaļ social hierarchy: 'the really important category was status,, and
as such it was 'fundamental to all oiher categories'.e

That was certainlythe case when it came to the realities of running
the empire and making it work, rarher than merely talking about how
it was (or was not) working in terms of vague, abstract generarizations.
Since most Britons came from what they believed to be a hierarchicar
society, it was natural for them, when doing business or negotiating
power, to search for overseas collaborators from the top ofthe indigen-
ous social spectrĮįm' rather than from lower down, whom they sup-
ported, whose cooperation they needed and through whom they
ruled.l. The British chose the allies they did abroad because of the
social conditioning and social perceptions they brought with them
from home. Moreover, and in conformiry with the historic traditions
and practices of British local government, this also made financial
sense. If the empire was ro be run on the cheap (as with a low_taxing
metropolis it had to be), there must be voluntary collaborators; and,
as the history of Britain itself made plain, the best people to collaborate
with were likely to be the rich, welĻborn and powerful. In short, these
imperial peoples ļ,vefe no aggregated, collective mass, aĮl regarded as
inferior and potentially hostile: they were seen differentiaily and often
individually.ll Depending on contexr and circumstance, botb whire
ąnd dark-skinned peoples of empire were seen as superior; or, alterna-
tively, as inferior.

This in turn helps to explain why it was that when the British
contemplated and imagined their far-flung empire, and thought about
and visuaļized those many diverse races who inhabited it, they were at
least as likely to look down on whites as theyrwere to look up to those
with darker skins, to disparage those who resembled themselves, but
to acclaim those who belonged to other races. It may have been true
that the British ovefseas came hom the same original raciaļ stock as
the British at home, but, for all their shared skin colour and racial
kinship, the metropolitans never lost'the basic sense of their superioriry
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of rank and wisdom over mere colonials'. In the eighteenth century,

Whig grandees and their clients looked down on returning nabobs as

vuĮgar upstarts.įz Īn the nineteenth century, Britons in Austraļia were

drsmissed for being lrish Catholic, or the descendants of convicts, or

both. And in the twentieth century, visitors to Britain from the great

dominions were often treated with extreme condescension, as in Noēl

Coward's ry8 play Hands Across the Sea. Alļ of which is simply to

observe that throuģout its history, many metroPolitan Britons saw

their settlement empire, not as a great white hope, but as a sociological

dumping ground for hicks and bumpkins and (even) criminals: as 'a

last resort for people who have ruined themselves at home'.r3

Thus regarded, the British Empire seemed to be full of the dross and

detritus of the British metropolis: convicts and their progeny sent as

far away from home as possible; poor re|ects from the slums and tļre

back streets of Birmingham and Glasgow; failed professional-s-įn the

law and the church and the military; and indebrcd and scandal-bliģted

aristocrats shipped off and out of the way. These were roodess, mar-

ginal people, unable to frnd or take or keep their place in the metropoĮi-

tan sociaļ order, or cast out from it. They were the poor wĻites or the

white trash of thetr time.ra By c ntrast, the native princes,'ruling chiefs,

lordly emirs and exotic sheikhs seemed much more like black gold:

bemer people, at the apex of a better world, which was ordered,

traditional, settled, time-honoured, face-to-face, decent, wholesome

and uncorrupt. In certain contexts and situations, the British did regard

the dark-skinned members of their empire as more admirable, more

important and more noble than white men. This is not the whole truth

of things. But it is a substantial, a significant and a neglected truth.

And to the extent that it is, we ourselves need to recognize that

there were other ways of seeing the empire than in the oversimplified

categones of black and white with which we are so preoccupied. It is

time we reoriented orientaļism.ls

For we should rļot suppose that the on-ly way to approach and

recover the history of the British Empire is through the antagonistic,

stereotypical and unequal coļlectivities of race (any more than we

should suppose that the only ways to approach and recover the history

of humankind or of production are throuģ the antagonistic, stereo-
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rypical and unequai corectivities of men versus women or of middre-class bosses versus working-crass rabourers). That these were a part ofimperial (as of gender and of economic) history įt is no purpose of thisbook to deny, But thEl were onĮy a'įart:For as welļ as collectiveconflicts, there was in the British Empire (as in interpersonar reration-ships and tJre productive process) *".1 inJ*raual cooperation, basedorr a shared recognition of equal .o.iįl .t"r,r.. And to the extent thatsuch'cuļtivation of affi nities' transcended the boundaries and barriersofcolour, they were, as Harry Liebersohn has observed, .an antidoteto racism''16Indeed, it may be that hierarchical empires *d ';;įr;where inequality was the norm, were in this sense ļess racist thanegalitarian societies, where there was (and is?) no alternatiye vision ofthe social order from that of collective, 
"rrt"ļonrrri. and often racialidentities' Such a concļusion - th"t p".t ,o.r.',,", and empires, predi-cated on individual inequaliry, h"J *"y. of dealing with race thatcontemporary societies, dedicated to collective equality, do ,ro, - *"įnot be comforting for us today. But that does not necessarily detract

-from its historical valiidity.l,

Understood in this 
:1y, ". a conservative, traditional, orderedphenomenon, the British Empire was not exclusively about race orcolour' but was aļso about class and status. This in furn means that itwas about antiquity and anachronir-, t.rdiįion and honour, ordera d subordination; about glory and chivalry, horses and elephants,knights and peers, processions and ceremony, įtu-.a ut, and erminerobes; about chiefs and emirs, sultans ,rra .r"įį r, viceroys and pro-consuls; about thrones and crowns, dominion and hierarchy, ostenta_tion and ornamenralism.r8 And that brings us back to JosephSchumpeter's original insight, in ImperlaĮism a"nd SociaĮ CĮasses, wherehe argued that the creation a d administration of nineteenth-century

empires was the result oĪ a shared sense of personal identity betweenthe most atavistic social groups in Europe, sėking escape from theįravails of industry' demqcracy and big cities, and those traditionaltribes and rulers overseas whom they ."i.-bt.į and found most sym-pathetic.le From this perspective, the impulses to empire were ancientrather than modern, and tļere was 
" 

po*ĻfuI, traditio aļ social vision
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29. King George VI's coronation, 1937.


